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Committee Meetings 

There are no meetings today.
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Future Meetings of the Parliament 

Business Programme agreed by the Parliament on 28 June 2023 

Tuesday 5 September 2023 

2:00 pm Time for Reflection 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Topical Questions (if selected) 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Committee Announcements 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Wednesday 6 September 2023 

2:00 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:00 pm Portfolio Questions: Wellbeing Economy, Fair Work and Energy; Finance and 
Parliamentary Business 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Approval of SSIs (if required) 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Thursday 7 September 2023 

11:40 am Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

11:40 am General Questions 

12:00 pm First Minister's Questions 

followed by Members' Business 

2:30 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:30 pm Portfolio Questions: Net Zero and Just Transition 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

Tuesday 12 September 2023 



Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 
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Gnothaichean ri teachd 
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2:00 pm Time for Reflection 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Topical Questions (if selected) 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Committee Announcements 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Wednesday 13 September 2023 

2:00 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:00 pm Portfolio Questions: Rural Affairs, Land Reform and Islands; NHS Recovery, Health and 
Social Care 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

followed by Approval of SSIs (if required) 

5:00 pm Decision Time 

followed by Members' Business 

Thursday 14 September 2023 

11:40 am Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

11:40 am General Questions 

12:00 pm First Minister's Questions 

followed by Members' Business 

2:30 pm Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

2:30 pm Portfolio Questions: Social Justice 

followed by Scottish Government Business 

followed by Business Motions 

followed by Parliamentary Bureau Motions 

5:00 pm Decision Time
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Future Committee Meetings 

The future business of the Parliament has not yet been agreed to.
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Motions 

Motions and amendments are usually printed the day after lodging. When an amendment is 
lodged, then the original motion will be republished alongside it. 
 
Motions and amendments can be published with symbols: 
 
*    before the number indicates publication for the first time 
*…* around a section of text indicates changes to previously published material  
R   indicates a member has declared a registered interest 
 
The Parliamentary Bureau periodically deletes motions or amendments that are over six weeks old 
and not scheduled for debate. 
 
Questions regarding this section should be directed to the Chamber Desk. 

Members' Business motions that have achieved cross party support 

*S6M-09980 Paul Sweeney: Funding for Glasgow's World-leading Cultural Attractions—That 
the Parliament congratulates Glasgow Life and The Burrell Collection, which was gifted to 
Glasgow by the late shipping magnate, William Burrell, on winning the Art Fund Museum of the 
Year 2023; notes that the six-year refurbishment and redisplay of one of Scotland's largest art 
collections was regarded by the judges as world-class; considers that the potential loss of 37 of 
128 posts within Glasgow Life would degrade the quality and potential of Glasgow’s 10 museums 
and art galleries; believes that Glasgow Life’s reported proposal to cut these jobs would be 
detrimental to the ability of the organisation to undertake world-leading exhibition and renovation 
programmes; recognises that a number of culturally significant attractions in the city, such as the 
People’s Palace and Winter Gardens at Glasgow Green, have reportedly been unable to secure 
the necessary capital investment to remain fully operational in recent years, and notes the calls on 
the Scottish Government to recognise the national and global importance of Glasgow’s museums 
and art galleries by providing direct national funding for their operation and upkeep on a similar 
basis to that of top Edinburgh attractions. 

Supported by: Richard Leonard*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Miles Briggs*, Paul O'Kane*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09975 Bob Doris: 75 Years of Marie Curie—That the Parliament congratulates Marie 
Curie on its 75th anniversary; recognises that, since its inception in 1948, Marie Curie has 
provided palliative and end of life care and support to millions of people affected by terminal illness 
and those dealing with dying, death, and bereavement across the UK; understands that Marie 
Curie works closely with NHS Scotland and is the largest provider of palliative care services for 
adults outside the NHS; believes that access to appropriate palliative care services is a key 
element of ensuring the best possible end of life experience; welcomes what it sees as the 
invaluable contribution of the Marie Curie nursing and volunteer services and its two hospices in 
Edinburgh and Glasgow; commends its most recent report, How Many People Need Palliative 
Care?, which was published on 6 July 2023 and maps palliative care need across the UK into the 
late 2040s; understands that, according to the report, palliative care need will increase by more 
than 25% across the UK by 2048; notes its prediction that the number of 85 year olds living in 
Scotland will increase by 90% by 2048 to 257,000; considers that, while welcome, this presents a 
challenge to palliative care services as the number of people with comorbidities in need of 
complex person-centred care and pain management at the end of life will also increase; 
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understands that Marie Curie is the largest charitable funder of palliative and end of life research; 
commends the work of all at Marie Curie, including its clinical staff, support services and volunteer 
helper services, who work to ensure that everyone has the best possible end of life experience, 
and looks forward to further developing Scotland’s public policy and delivery framework to most 
effectively meet that goal.   

Supported by: Gordon MacDonald*, John Mason*, Kenneth Gibson*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, 
Annabelle Ewing*, Liam McArthur*, Pauline McNeill*, David Torrance*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, 
Paul O'Kane*, Colin Beattie*, Brian Whittle*, Pam Gosal*, Karen Adam* 

Other new and altered motions and amendments 

*S6M-10006 Alexander Stewart: Carron Valley Community Woodland Commended in 
Scotland’s Finest Woods Awards for 2023—That the Parliament congratulates Carron Valley 
Community Woodland on being "commended" in the Large Community Woodland Group 
competition within Scotland’s Finest Woods Awards for 2023; understands that the Carron Valley 
and District Community took ownership of 52 acres, or 21 hectares, of woodland to the east of the 
Carron Valley reservoir, known as the Carron Valley Community Woodland, in 2018; believes that 
since that time, and along with the support of expert professionals, they have developed an 
ecologically responsible community asset that benefits nature, residents and visitors alike; 
understands that, through this work, in excess of 9,000 native trees have been planted, new paths 
have been created, and volunteer activities, social events, and biodiversity and conservation 
projects have taken place with the aim of providing immediate and long-term benefits, for both 
nature and for people, and congratulates all involved on their significant endeavours for the 
community. 

*S6M-10005 Alexander Stewart: Scotland’s Finest Woods Award for Doune Community 
Woodland Group, Doune Ponds—That the Parliament congratulates Doune Community 
Woodland Group on Doune Ponds, after it won the Small Community Woodland Group category in 
Scotland’s Finest Woods Awards for 2023; understands that, since the group took over the project 
in 2014, the ponds, which were previously described as unloved, have been transformed by the 
diligence and commitment of all the volunteers involved; considers that they have also been 
recognised a number of times and that the ponds are now considered as a wonderful asset for the 
whole community; acknowledges that Doune Ponds were the winners of Scotland’s Finest Woods 
Awards in the Community Woodland category in 2017, and that they were shortlisted for the RSPB 
Nature of Scotland Award and came "highly commended" in Scotland’s Finest Woods Awards in 
2019; notes that the majority of work carried out at the ponds is by a group of dedicated 
volunteers, who have committed time and energy to making Doune Ponds what it is today; 
understands that the group meets every Wednesday morning to carry out all manner of 
maintenance tasks as well as major projects and that it also runs community weekend 
volunteering sessions for anyone who would like to attend, and commends everyone involved for 
their tireless work and dedication in this regard. 

Supported by: Douglas Ross*, Miles Briggs*, David Torrance*, Craig Hoy*, Brian Whittle*, Annie 
Wells*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Murdo Fraser*, Colin Beattie*, Russell Findlay*, Jamie Greene*, Pam 
Gosal*, Bill Kidd* 

*S6M-10003 Michael Marra: £1 Million to Save the Unicorn—That the Parliament welcomes the 
provision of £1.1 million from the National Heritage Memorial Fund (NHMF) to the Unicorn 
Preservation Society, which is earmarked for use in carrying out urgent repairs; believes that the 
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repairs will sustain the Unicorn, which was launched in 1824, into the future; recognises that it is 
the third oldest ship in the world and has a long history of service as a reserve ship and a training 
vessel for the Royal Navy, and now as a museum; understands that the ship arrived in Dundee in 
1873 and has sat on the city’s waterfront ever since as an integral part of Dundee's, Scotland's 
and Britain’s history and culture; recognises the large levels of care needed to preserve a ship so 
old, and is grateful to both the NHMF and the Unicorn Preservation Society for their work. 

Supported by: Martin Whitfield*, Colin Beattie*, Tess White*, Miles Briggs*, Colin Smyth*, Sarah 
Boyack*, David Torrance*, Jackie Baillie*, Pam Gosal*, Bill Kidd*, Pam Duncan-Glancy* 

*S6M-10002 David Torrance: Ben Sandilands Wins T20 1500m Para Athletics World Crown 
in Record Time—That the Parliament applauds Ben Sandilands, of Kirkcaldy, who won a gold 
medal in the T20 1500m Para Athletics World Championship race in Paris on 17 July 2023; 
understands that Ben, who was fifth with just 200m remaining, produced a blistering finish to take 
the honours in 3:52.42, breaking his own European record and setting a new championship 
record; recognises that Ben was part of a trio of Fife athletes, all coached by Steve Doig, who 
contested the final, with Fife AC’s Owen Miller finishing seventh in 3:58.22 and Steven Bryce, a 
member of Victoria Park City of Glasgow Athletics Club, coming 13th in 4:03.80; notes that Ben is 
targeting an appearance at T20s most prestigious event, the Paralympics, with the next staging 
due to be held in Paris from 28 August to 8 September 2024; celebrates Ben’s drive and 
determination to become the best athlete he can be, and wishes him all the best in his ambition to 
reach the Paralympics, as well as all other events he competes in. 

Supported by: Miles Briggs*, Kenneth Gibson*, Rona Mackay*, Colin Beattie*, Pam Gosal*, Bill 
Kidd*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Jackie Dunbar* 

*S6M-10001 Brian Whittle: Kilmarnock FC Promotes Science Education through Design of 
New Kit—That the Parliament applauds the efforts of Kilmarnock FC to promote science 
education and support the local community while paying homage to its local history; understands 
that the football club has launched a new kit design, to be worn at away games, featuring 
penicillin’s chemical compound; further understands that the design will be used by the Killie 
Community team to educate local pupils about the revolutionary discovery by Kilmarnock 
Academy’s own Alexander Fleming in 1928; notes that Alexander Fleming won a Nobel Prize in 
Physiology or Medicine in 1945 for the discovery; further notes that a percentage of the revenue 
from the shirt sales will be donated to the club’s local charity partner, the Crosshouse Children’s 
Fund, which supports the treatment of babies, children and young adults across Ayrshire; 
commends Kilmarnock FC on its positive use of its platform, and wishes it all the best as the 
season begins. 

Supported by: Alexander Stewart*, Miles Briggs*, Craig Hoy*, David Torrance*, Edward 
Mountain*, Annie Wells*, Kenneth Gibson*, Liam Kerr*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Colin Beattie*, Jamie 
Greene*, Pam Gosal*, Bill Kidd*, Pam Duncan-Glancy* 

*S6M-10000 Kenneth Gibson: Community Windpower’s £300,000 Dalry Energy Fund—That 
the Parliament welcomes a £300,000 fund to help the people of Dalry Parish, North Ayrshire, with 
their energy bills; understands that the fund came into being as a result of a partnership between 
Community Windpower and the Dalry Parish Boundary Trust and was administered by Advice 
Direct Scotland; is aware that the fund is targeted at households with children living in poverty, 
people living with cancer, those in receipt of a disability benefit, pensioners and households that 
use a large amount of energy to power medical equipment; understands that, so far, 589 
households in the KA24 postcode area have had their application accepted and that a total of 
£193,200 has been paid out as of 14 July 2023; acknowledges that payments for electricity usage 
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were issued via PayPoint or Post Office vouchers, and that the money was sent directly to 
suppliers for those with credit meters; is aware that the fund was supported directly from 
Community Windpower’s onshore wind farm near Dalry and follows a similar scheme in East 
Lothian, where £1 million helped over 1,400 vulnerable families and individuals; welcomes that 
Community Windpower’s total community offering throughout Scotland has now, it understands, 
reached over £8 million; recognises that the Dalry Parish Boundary Trust was set up in 2014 and 
has since supported numerous organisations, schools, youth and sports organisations, as well as 
individuals, especially during the COVID-19 pandemic; appreciates that John Smith, secretary of 
the Trust, said that when the energy and food crisis raised its head, they decided to look at what 
and who they could help in the town, and wishes everyone in the Dalry Parish Boundary trust and 
Community Windpower every success in their future endeavours. 

*S6M-09998 Sharon Dowey: Opening of New Cumnock Honeypot Dalleagles Respite Facility 
for Young Carers—That the Parliament applauds the work of the Honeypot Children’s Charity in 
opening the new Honeypot Dalleagles respite facility for young carers in New Cumnock; 
understands that the facility will provide valuable breaks and an escape from stress and at home 
demands for young carers, as the charity works towards its aim of supporting young carers, and 
that it will receive its first guests on 11 August 2023; notes that the opening of the facility marks 
the expansion of the Honeypot Children’s Charity’s respite facilities into Scotland; believes that the 
new respite facility will further help disadvantaged young people to reach their full potential within 
Scotland; recognises the contributions of the Richard Porter Family Foundation and Simon Clarke 
for sponsoring Honeypot Dalleagles; acknowledges the plans to further expand the facility, and 
wishes all the best to the charity as it aims to fulfil its goal of supporting young carers. 

Supported by: Alexander Stewart*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Douglas Ross*, Bill Kidd*, Edward 
Mountain*, Annie Wells*, Miles Briggs*, David Torrance*, Meghan Gallacher*, Pam Duncan-
Glancy*, Colin Beattie*, Liam Kerr*, Jamie Greene*, Russell Findlay*, Pam Gosal*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Craig Hoy*, Brian Whittle* 

*S6M-09997 Sharon Dowey: Opening of the Staff Wellbeing Centre at University Hospital 
Ayr—That the Parliament welcomes the opening of the staff wellbeing centre at University 
Hospital Ayr; acknowledges that this represents the opening of the last of three staff wellbeing 
centres in NHS Ayrshire and Arran, with centres currently active at Ayrshire Central Hospital and 
University Hospital Crosshouse; understands that these wellbeing centres provide staff with an 
opportunity to cope with the emotional and physical stress that comes with their line of work, away 
from a clinical setting; recognises that the opening of this centre will provide staff within University 
Hospital Ayr with the opportunity to access greater support in areas such as clinical psychology 
and staff care; believes that these centres will help to meet the support needs of many staff by 
allowing them to come together to support each other in upholding the provision of high-quality 
care to patients; considers that staff wellbeing centres play a key role in making medical workers 
feel valued and cared for within their work, and wishes the best to the new staff wellbeing centre at 
University Hospital Ayr in providing support to medical staff. 

Supported by: Douglas Ross*, Alexander Stewart*, Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Sandesh Gulhane* 
R, Edward Mountain*, Annie Wells*, Miles Briggs*, David Torrance*, Liam Kerr*, Jamie Greene*, 
Russell Findlay*, Pam Gosal*, Paul Sweeney*, Craig Hoy*, Brian Whittle* 

*S6M-09996 Annabelle Ewing: John Gilfillan BEM Donates £1,000 To Lochgelly High School 
Prom Cause—That the Parliament commends John Gilfillan BEM, who is a local businessman 
and philanthropist from Cardenden, Fife, for donating £1,000 to supporting pupils to attend 
Lochgelly High School's end of year prom; understands that John kindly donated this sum after 
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hearing that several young people would potentially miss out on the opportunity to attend the prom 
because of the very difficult financial crisis that has been facing many local families; believes that 
the cost of living crisis could have prevented the young people from making lasting memories with 
their fellow classmates and teaching staff; recognises that the funding was used to obtain suits, 
dresses, jackets, shoes, and more for the pupils, and thanks John for his generosity, which was 
appreciated by all. 

Supported by: David Torrance*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Paul Sweeney*, 
Colin Beattie* R, Fergus Ewing* 

*S6M-09995 Paul O'Kane: Changing Places Awareness Day 2023—That the Parliament 
understands that Changing Places Awareness Day 2023 took place on 19 July; further 
understands that the day was established as a way to raise awareness of the lack of appropriate 
toilet facilities for people with limited mobility and severe physical disabilities, and also to mark the 
progress that has been made by campaigners in increasing that provision and improving the 
quality of changing places toilets; notes that the Scottish Government made what it sees as a 
significant manifesto pledge to invest £10 million in changing places toilets, which subsequently 
became part of the Programme for Government; considers that it has now been two years since 
this pledge was made, and understands that there has been no announcement regarding the 
distribution of the promised funding or any details on the application process; believes that, without 
a more widespread effort to increase the provision of changing places, there will still be people 
with disabilities who are forced to change in inappropriate toilets and whose ability to travel far 
across the country will be severely limited; celebrates the efforts of changing places campaigners, 
such as Jill Clark, who, it believes, has worked incredibly hard to ensure that the provision of 
changing places toilets in Glasgow has increased in places such as shopping centres and train 
stations, and considers that access to a toilet suitable to a person's own needs should be 
considered a very basic yet vital human right. 

Supported by: Miles Briggs*, Jackie Baillie*, Liam McArthur*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Tess White*, 
Pam Gosal*, Pam Duncan-Glancy* 

*S6M-09994 Annabelle Ewing: Andy's Man Club Duo Raises £2,400 in Non-stop 96-mile 
West Highland Way—That the Parliament congratulates Kevin Woodward, of Cowdenbeath, and 
Stuart MacKenzie, of Ballingry, on their fundraising efforts in raising £2,400 for Andy's Man Club; 
understands that the pair suffered and endured immense pain to complete the gruelling mental 
and physical challenge of walking the 96-mile West Highland Way non-stop over 39 hours; further 
understands that there were times when the pair wanted to quit the walk, but that they persevered 
and pushed each other on, from morning through to the night, to reach the end at Fort William, 
having set off from Milngavie; thanks them for their efforts to fundraise and raise awareness for 
such a worthy cause, and wishes them all the best in their recovery from the walk. 

Supported by: David Torrance*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Paul Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, Fergus 
Ewing* 

*S6M-09993 Annabelle Ewing: National Lottery Heritage Fund Makes Award to My 
Cowdenbeath CIC —That the Parliament congratulates My Cowdenbeath CIC on being 
successfully awarded £9,980 from the National Lottery Heritage Fund for its new project, 
Cowdenbeath's Civic Heritage; understands that the aim is to create a project for the local people 
of Cowdenbeath to reconnect with their history and heritage by making thousands of archive 
images of the much-loved Gala Days and Civic Week events available online for the first time; 
recognises that the National Lottery Heritage Fund invests money, raised by National Lottery 
players, in museums, parks and historic places, as well as in archaeology, the natural environment 
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and cultural traditions; thanks the National Lottery Heritage Fund for backing the project, and 
wishes those at My Cowdenbeath CIC all the very best for their project. 

Supported by: David Torrance*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Paul Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, Fergus 
Ewing* 

*S6M-09992 Annabelle Ewing: Lochgelly 5ives Reach CRT Home Internationals 2023—That 
the Parliament congratulates the players of Lochgelly 5ives team on reaching the Coalfields 
Regeneration Trust's Home Internationals 2023; understands that the team competed with other 
local football teams from coalfield communities across Scotland to secure its place in the 
tournament; recognises that the tournament brings together teams of young footballers from 
coalfield communities across Scotland, England and Wales to compete together in Manchester, 
and will take place at Manchester City Stadium, on 30 July 2023; commends the team for its hard 
work in achieving its place at the tournament, and wishes it all the very best for the tournament. 

Supported by: David Torrance*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd* R, Paul 
Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, Fergus Ewing* 

*S6M-09991 Beatrice Wishart: Celebrating Team Shetland at the Islands Games 2023—That 
the Parliament celebrates the success of the 2023 NatWest International Island Games; 
understands that teams of athletes from 24 islands gathered in Guernsey from 8 to 14 July to 
compete in a range of sports, including teams from Shetland, Orkney and the Western Isles; 
further understands that this marked the 19th Island Games, with the first having taken place in 
1985 on the Isle of Man; believes that the Island Games motivate and foster sporting communities 
in the islands, promoting a healthy lifestyle, providing a focus for young people and strengthening 
islands’ cultural identities; congratulates the 103-strong team from Shetland, which represented 
the island in archery, athletics, badminton, road cycling, golf, football, sailing, swimming, table 
tennis and triathlon, with many competitors reaching the finals of their respective sports; further 
congratulates swimmer, Jasmin Smith, on winning silver in the Women’s 100m breaststroke and 
bronze in the Women’s 50m breaststroke, athletes Seumas MacKay, on winning silver in the 
Men’s 1500m and Men’s 800m, and Katie Dinwoodie, on winning bronze in the Women’s 100m 
and Women’s 200m, and the Women’s Triathlon Team on winning bronze; commends cyclist, 
Carlos Riise, and swimmers, Anne and Emmie Hutchison, for their roles in the opening ceremony 
as flag bearer and water carriers respectively; recognises the hard work of the Shetland Islands 
Games Association, competitors and officials that makes the Shetland team’s participation 
possible; congratulates all involved in the 2023 NatWest International Island Games, and wishes 
Orkney success as the host of the event in 2025. 

Supported by: Liam McArthur*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Alex Rowley*, Annabelle Ewing*, Finlay 
Carson*, Bill Kidd*, Tess White*, Paul Sweeney*, Colin Beattie* 

*S6M-09990 Alexander Burnett: Finlay Shand Named Young Gamekeeper of the Year—That 
the Parliament congratulates Finlay Shand, 22, on receiving the Young Gamekeeper of the Year 
Award 2023; understands that this award recognises individuals in the early stages of a career on 
land or river, who are adjudged to stand apart as ambassadors for gamekeeping, deer stalking or 
ghillieing; further understands that Mr Shand was commended for his passion, maturity and 
willingness to help educate others about the values of good stewardship of Scotland’s countryside; 
notes that Mr Shand’s clay shooting prowess was praised and that he will soon travel to Ireland to 
represent Scotland in the Down the Line shooting discipline at the European and British 
championships; commends Mr Shand on what it sees as his exceptional achievement at such a 
young age, and wishes him every success in his career for the future. 
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Supported by: Alexander Stewart*, Meghan Gallacher*, Craig Hoy*, David Torrance*, Douglas 
Ross*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Colin Beattie*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Russell Findlay*, Brian Whittle*, 
Miles Briggs*, Annie Wells*, Jamie Greene*, Paul Sweeney*, Tess White*, Finlay Carson*, Liam 
Kerr*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09989 Collette Stevenson: Celebrating East Kilbride’s Independent Retailers—That the 
Parliament congratulates all the retailers shortlisted for the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 
2023; understands that the awards celebrate independent retailers’ achievements, resilience, 
innovation and dedication to serving their local communities; notes that five independent retailers 
in East Kilbride were on the list, including Hunter House Coffee Shop, Optomeyes Opticians, All 4 
Pets and The Pet Empawrium; celebrates what it sees as the benefits that such independent 
retailers bring to Scotland’s communities, and wishes them all the best for the future. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, David Torrance*, Annabelle Ewing*, Gillian Mackay*, Jackie 
Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Colin Beattie* 

*S6M-09988 Collette Stevenson: Congratulations to East Kilbride’s Award-winning Village 
Blinds—That the Parliament congratulates Village Blinds, in East Kilbride, on winning Soft 
Furnishings Supplier of the Year at the 10th Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023; 
understands that the awards celebrate independent retailers’ achievements, resilience, innovation 
and dedication to serving their local communities; recognises that Village Blinds is a family-owned 
business that has been operating for over three decades, and now has branches in East Kilbride, 
Bellshill and Clarkston; celebrates what it sees as the benefits that independent retailers, such as 
Village Blinds, bring to Scotland’s communities, and wishes it all the best for the future. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, David Torrance*, Annabelle Ewing*, Gillian Mackay*, Jackie 
Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Colin Beattie* 

*S6M-09987 Michelle Thomson: Falkirk East Businesses and Individuals Nominated at 
Scottish Funeral Awards 2023—That the Parliament congratulates Thomas Sneddon Funeral 
Directors, Colin J Wright Funeral Directors, Daniel Sweeney and Craig Flowers on their 
nominations at the Scottish Funeral Awards 2023; understands that the final award ceremony will 
be held in Glasgow on 18 August 2023; further understands that Paramount Creative organises 
these annual awards, with the ethos of the event being to recognise hardworking business owners 
who go above and beyond to ensure that they provide an excellent service to their patrons; notes 
that Daniel Sweeney, also known as Piper Dan, is nominated in the Best Piper category, and that 
Craig Flowers is nominated in the Best Celebrant category; congratulates once again Thomas 
Sneddon Funeral Directors, Colin J Wright Funeral Directors, Daniel Sweeney and Craig Flowers 
on receiving their nominations in recognition of their outstanding service, and wishes them all the 
best of luck for the upcoming ceremony. 

Supported by: Bill Kidd*, David Torrance*, Colin Beattie*, Miles Briggs*, Gillian Mackay*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09986 Liam Kerr: Aberdeen Autism Support Charity, A-ND, Raises £46,000 at 
Inaugural Fundraising Dinner  —That the Parliament congratulates Autism and Neurodiversity 
North Scotland (A-ND) on the monumental success of its first-ever fundraising event, Think 
Different Golf Day and Dinner, held in May 2023; understands that the charity raised an 
impressive sum of £46,000, allowing A-ND to focus on areas of expansion; further understands 
that the charity currently offers support to 150 individuals and families across the north of 
Scotland, with a target to increase this number to 500 by 2027, and works with ThinkPR Scotland 
Ltd, a local business that generously gives up its services, time and resources in aid of A-ND and 
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other local charities; notes that the "Binky the Sensory Bus" initiative aims to extend A-ND’s 
outreach services to autistic and neurodivergent individuals and their families, who, it believes, 
currently lack essential support, and wishes A-ND and its service users all the best for future 
activities. 

Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Edward Mountain*, Alexander Stewart*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, 
Alexander Burnett* R, Jackie Dunbar*, Russell Findlay*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Miles Briggs*, 
Sandesh Gulhane*, Annie Wells*, David Torrance*, Douglas Ross*, Pam Gosal*, Jamie Greene*, 
Colin Beattie*, Craig Hoy*, Brian Whittle*, Bill Kidd*, Karen Adam* 

*S6M-09985 Roz McCall: Congratulating Jeannette Miller On Her Work With Care 
Experienced Children —That the Parliament congratulates Jeannette Miller on her recent 
graduation from Queen Margaret University, with a Bachelor of Science in Public Sociology; notes 
that Jennette has lived in Fife for most her life; understands that she has dedicated herself to 
standing up for care experienced young people and ensuring that the Scottish Government 
delivers The Promise; further understands that Jennette is a student ambassador for the HUB for 
SUCCESS in Edinburgh and that, in that role, she plays a pivotal role in helping care experienced 
young people succeed in higher education, and wishes Jeannette all the best for the future as she 
continues to fight for care experienced young people. 
 

Supported by: Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Meghan Gallacher*, Alexander Stewart*, Sandesh Gulhane*, 
Russell Findlay*, Colin Beattie*, Miles Briggs*, Brian Whittle*, Douglas Ross*, David Torrance*, 
Annie Wells*, Edward Mountain*, Paul Sweeney*, Pam Gosal*, Tess White*, Craig Hoy*, Finlay 
Carson*, Liam Kerr* 

*S6M-09984 Bob Doris: Funding Successes for Concrete Garden—That the Parliament 
welcomes two significant funding awards for the Concrete Garden in the Maryhill and Springburn 
constituency; understands that £140,287 has been secured through the Scottish Land Fund, which 
will look to support the community purchase of two plots of derelict land in Possilpark; further 
understands that the ambition is to create a child-owned and child-led adventure playground on 
the derelict site and to redevelop the existing community garden to ensure that it is a vibrant 
community-led asset for generations to come; welcomes the £99,998 grant from the National 
Lottery Community Fund Young Start awards; believes that, over the three years, approximately 
750 young people and 60 volunteers will be involved in the project, which will support its Volunteer 
Project, Outdoor Play Project and Growing Well - social and therapeutic gardening projects; 
recognises the funding secured from Glasgow City Council’s Communities Fund and Holiday Food 
fund, and thanks all involved in giving young people many opportunities to work, play, learn and 
grow together. 

Supported by: Audrey Nicoll*, Kenneth Gibson*, Bill Kidd*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Rona Mackay*, 
Colin Beattie*, David Torrance*, Miles Briggs*, Clare Haughey*, Paul Sweeney*, Annabelle 
Ewing*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jackie Dunbar*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09983 Michael Marra: The 2023 World Union of Karate-Do Federations (WUKF) World 
Karate Championships in Dundee—That the Parliament congratulates Dundee’s Kanzen Karate 
on the successful hosting of the World Union of Karate-Do Federations (WUKF) World Karate 
Championships in July 2023; recognises that over 5,000 athletes, coaches, officials and 
spectators from five continents and 62 karate federations attended the event in Dundee; notes that 
this is the second time in five years that the city has hosted the event, with a similarly impressive 
championship taking place in 2018, which, it understands, contributed millions to the local 
economy; believes that the economic boost to Dundee from the 2023 tournament is estimated to 
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be in excess of £10 million; commends what it sees as the remarkable work of Kanzen Karate, its 
Chief Officer, Roy O’Kane, and WUKF; thanks them for their contribution to the Dundee and 
Scottish economies, and wishes organisers, competitors and supporters the very best for their 
future endeavours. 

Supported by: Martin Whitfield*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Kenneth Gibson*, 
David Torrance*, Miles Briggs*, Paul Sweeney*, Tess White*, Paul O'Kane*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09982 Kaukab Stewart: Condemning the Illegal Migration Bill—That the Parliament 
condemns the passage of the Illegal Migration Bill through the House of Commons and the House 
of Lords; considers that the bill criminalises refugees who are seeking safe sanctuary in the UK; 
believes that it will do little to deter the real criminals who make profit from people trafficking, which 
endangers the lives of vulnerable refugees; understands that The Law Society has expressed 
concern that the bill may be incompatible with the UK’s international obligations under the 
European Court of Human Rights and the UN Refugee Convention and that this could undermine 
the rule of law; considers that there remains no viable system for applying for asylum in the UK 
outside of very limited nation-specific schemes, and calls on the UK Government to create a 
system of safe and legal passage for asylum seekers and refugees, or to devolve sufficient 
powers to allow Scotland to do so.   

Supported by: Bill Kidd*, John Mason*, Colin Beattie*, Rona Mackay*, David Torrance*, Evelyn 
Tweed*, Audrey Nicoll*, Bob Doris*, Clare Haughey*, Annabelle Ewing*, Ivan McKee*, Jackie 
Dunbar*, Karen Adam* 

*S6M-09981 Finlay Carson: The Five Kingdoms Brewery Wins First Ever CAMRA Award—
That the Parliament warmly congratulates the Five Kingdoms Brewery on winning the Mild 
category of the prestigious 2023 Scotland and Northern Ireland Campaign for Real Ale (CAMRA) 
Champion Beer Competition; notes that Isle of Whithorn brewery took the top title with its 
McGregors Mild; recognises that this is the first time that managing director, Alistair Scoular, and 
his team at the Galloway brewery have been recognised by CAMRA; understands that they hope 
to expand the business, thanks to the growth of its bottle, cans and cask ale products into new 
outlets in Dumfries and Galloway and Ayrshire; further understands that the business has received 
assistance from South of Scotland Enterprise and Scotland Food and Drink, as well as Heriot Watt 
University, in its drive to create a new brewery that will be carbon efficient and use renewable 
energy sources, and wishes Five Kingdoms continued success in the future, especially with its 
plans to create a new visitor centre and tap room to increase capacity and become a top 
attraction. 

Supported by: Edward Mountain*, Colin Beattie*, Liam Kerr*, Douglas Ross*, Alexander Stewart*, 
Annie Wells*, Miles Briggs*, Russell Findlay*, Tess White*, Meghan Gallacher*, Craig Hoy*, Pam 
Gosal*, Sandesh Gulhane*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Bill Kidd*, Brian Whittle*, Paul Sweeney* 

*S6M-09979 Clare Adamson: Jacqueline Woods Nominated for Care Heroes Award 2023   —
That the Parliament congratulates Jacqueline Woods, from Wishaw, who was a finalist in the City 
and County Healthcare Group's Care Heroes Awards 2023; understands that Jacqueline is an 
employee of Constance Care; notes that the awards ceremony consisted of nine categories, each 
dedicated to celebrating the outstanding contributions made by frontline care staff who deliver vital 
support UK-wide; understands that the event brought together many care workers to celebrate the 
extraordinary work that they do; congratulates Jacqueline on reaching the finals, and thanks her 
for her compassion and dedication to providing the highest standard of care. 
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Supported by: Paul Sweeney*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Annabelle Ewing*, Gillian Mackay*, David 
Torrance*, Jackie Dunbar*, Roz McCall*, Miles Briggs*, Bill Kidd*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09978 Kenneth Gibson: Calling for Scotland and the UK to Emulate EU Nature 
Restoration Law—That the Parliament supports the European Parliament’s recent vote in favour 
of a nature restoration law, which will place recovery measures on 20% of the EU's land and sea 
areas by 2030, rising to cover all ecosystems in need of restoration by 2050; is aware that a 2019 
global study, carried out by the Intergovernmental Science-Policy Platform for Biodiversity and 
Ecosystem Services, found that 75% of the world’s land surface and 66% of seas have been 
significantly altered by humans, while more than 85% of wetland areas have been lost; recognises 
that the EU’s binding targets to restore degraded ecosystems are aimed at reversing what it sees 
as this worrying trend; is aware that, in the run-up to the vote, an open letter signed by over 6,000 
scientists highlighted studies showing that restoring nature would improve food security, help 
fisheries, create jobs and save money, while opponents of the law "not only lack scientific 
evidence, but even contradict it"; notes with concern that the State of Nature Scotland Report 
2019 concluded that, in Scotland, 49% of species had decreased in abundance between 1994 and 
2016; acknowledges that the Scottish Government’s investment in biodiversity and nature 
restoration continues to grow, including through £250 million to restore peatlands, and through 
planting more trees than any other part of the UK every year, and urges both the UK and Scottish 
governments to emulate the EU nature restoration law by ramping up the pace of action to combat 
biodiversity loss, not least by also introducing statutory nature restoration targets. 

Supported by: Audrey Nicoll*, David Torrance*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, John Mason* 

*S6M-09977 Ross Greer: Calling for an End to the Two-child Benefit Cap and "Rape 
Clause”—That the Parliament condemns the two-child limit for social security payments, a UK 
Government policy that came into effect in 2017, which, it believes, has inflicted hardship, trauma 
and anxiety onto hundreds of thousands of low-income and vulnerable families across the UK; 
notes with concern recent reports from the Child Poverty Action Group, which highlight that 80,000 
children in Scotland have been negatively impacted by this policy, and that one in 10 children 
across the UK are in households affected by the cap, as well as separate reports that, in the first 
three years of the policy’s operation, almost 1,000 women across the UK were forced to disclose 
that one of their children had been conceived as a result of rape in order to receive relevant social 
security payments, and agrees with the children’s charities, women's organisations, faith groups, 
human rights defenders and others that have consistently called for the UK Government to end 
what it sees as this cruel policy. 

*S6M-09976 Sharon Dowey: Ayr Postman, John Price, Retires after 44 years of Service—
That the Parliament recognises the retirement of long-serving Ayr Postman, John Price; notes that 
John has been a postman with Royal Mail since 1978; acknowledges that John has taken the 
decision to retire at the age of 65 after over 44 years of service; understands that he has become 
well known over the years across Ayr and has delivered mail to many families, including the late 
Scottish country singer, Sydney Devine; believes that he will be missed by colleagues, friends and 
family from his walking routes; applauds his dedication to his role and service to the community 
over the years, and wishes John a happy and well-deserved retirement.  

Supported by: Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Alexander Stewart*, Tess White*, Edward Mountain*, 
Meghan Gallacher*, Miles Briggs*, Pam Gosal*, David Torrance*, Craig Hoy*, Sandesh Gulhane*, 
Brian Whittle*, Douglas Ross*, Bill Kidd*, Russell Findlay*, Annie Wells*, Jamie Greene*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Finlay Carson*, Liam Kerr* 
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*S6M-09974 David Torrance: Kinghorn Salon Named Hair and Beauty Salon of the Year—
That the Parliament congratulates Kinghorn beauty salon, JCM Beauty Studio, on being named 
Hair and Beauty Salon of the Year (Central) at the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023; 
recognises that the Scottish Independent Retail Awards have always strived to recognise and 
celebrate the remarkable achievements of independent retailers; understands that the 2023 
winners have exemplified excellence in their sectors and have played a pivotal role in enhancing 
Scotland’s retail industry; believes that the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023 served as a 
testament to the resilience and creativity of independent retailers who continue to thrive in an ever-
evolving market; considers that these awards not only celebrate their achievements but also 
inspire others to pursue excellence in the Scottish retail sector; commends JCM Beauty Studio on 
being named Hair and Beauty Salon of the Year (Central), and wishes it all the best for the future. 
 

Supported by: Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Stuart McMillan*, 
Jeremy Balfour*, Paul Sweeney*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09973 David Torrance: Burntisland Ice Cream Shop Named Coffee Shop of the Year—
That the Parliament congratulates Burntisland ice cream shop, Novelli’s, on winning Coffee Shop 
of the Year (Central) at the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023; recognises that the Scottish 
Independent Retail Awards have always strived to recognise and celebrate the remarkable 
achievements of independent retailers; understands that the 2023 winners have exemplified 
excellence in their sectors and have played a pivotal role in enhancing Scotland’s retail industry; 
believes that the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023 served as a testament to the resilience 
and creativity of independent retailers who continue to thrive in an ever-evolving market; considers 
that these awards not only celebrate their achievements but also inspire others to pursue 
excellence in the Scottish retail sector; commends Novelli’s for winning Coffee Shop of the Year 
(Central), and wishes it all the best for the future. 

Supported by: Annabelle Ewing*, Alexander Stewart*, Bill Kidd*, Colin Beattie*, Jackie Dunbar*, 
Stuart McMillan*, Jeremy Balfour*, Paul Sweeney*, Roz McCall*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09972 David Torrance: Burntisland Dinner Club Named Eatery of the Year—That the 
Parliament congratulates Burntisland dinner club, The Cromwell Kitchen and Rooms, on winning 
Eatery of the Year for the central region at the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023, as well 
as the award for the category’s overall national winner; understands that the Scottish Independent 
Retail Awards have always strived to recognise and celebrate the remarkable achievements of 
independent retailers, with the 2023 winners having exemplified excellence in their sectors, and 
have played a pivotal role in enhancing Scotland’s retail industry; considers that the Scottish 
Independent Retail Awards 2023 served as a testament to the resilience and creativity of 
independent retailers, which continue to thrive in an ever-evolving market; believes that these 
awards not only celebrate their achievements, but also inspire others to pursue excellence in the 
Scottish retail sector; commends The Cromwell Kitchen and Rooms for winning Eatery of the Year 
for the central region, and wishes it all the best for the future. 

Supported by: Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Paul Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, 
Bill Kidd*, Roz McCall*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09971 David Torrance: Burntisland Pet Supply Store Named Independent Pet 
Supplies Store of the Year—That the Parliament congratulates Burntisland pet supply store, The 
Happy Go Lucky Dog Company, on being named Independent Pet Supplies Store of the Year at 
the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023; understands that the Scottish Independent Retail 
Awards have always strived to recognise and celebrate the remarkable achievements of 
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independent retailers, with the 2023 winners having exemplified excellence in their sectors, and 
have played a pivotal role in enhancing Scotland’s retail industry; considers that the Scottish 
Independent Retail Awards 2023 served as a testament to the resilience and creativity of 
independent retailers, which continue to thrive in an ever-evolving market; believes that these 
awards not only celebrate their achievements, but also inspire others to pursue excellence in the 
Scottish retail sector; commends The Happy Go Lucky Dog Company for winning Independent Pet 
Supplies Store of the Year, and wishes the company all the best for the future. 

Supported by: Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Rona Mackay*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09970 David Torrance: Burntisland Fish Merchants Named Fishmonger of the Year—
That the Parliament congratulates Burntisland fish merchants, C Sinclair Fresh Fish Merchants, on 
being named Fishmonger of the Year at the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023; 
understands that the Scottish Independent Retail Awards have always strived to recognise and 
celebrate the remarkable achievements of independent retailers, with the 2023 winners having 
exemplified excellence in their sectors, and have played a pivotal role in enhancing Scotland’s 
retail industry; considers that the Scottish Independent Retail Awards 2023 served as a testament 
to the resilience and creativity of independent retailers, which continue to thrive in an ever-evolving 
market; believes that these awards not only celebrate their achievements, but also inspire others 
to pursue excellence in the Scottish retail sector; commends C Sinclair Fresh Fish Merchants for 
winning Fishmonger of the Year, and wishes the company all the best for the future. 

Supported by: Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Edward Mountain*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09969 David Torrance: Popular Kirkcaldy Pub Wins Best in Fife at Scotland's 
Business Awards—That the Parliament congratulates Kirkcaldy town centre pub, Montagues, on 
winning the title of Best Licensed Premises at Scotland’s Business Awards for the Fife region; 
understands that the win means that the pub, which opened in December 2021, will have the 
opportunity to go on and represent Fife at the national awards later in 2023; further understands 
that the venue, which is part of the Amber Taverns estate in Scotland, is well known locally for its 
tasting flights, sports coverage and its unique wet-led model and great value; recognises that the 
award win is just the latest accolade for the pub, which has received Gold in its first Best Bar None 
assessment, thanks to extensive staff training, dedication to community safety and engagement 
with local charities; applauds the pub for winning the award, and wishes it all the best for the 
future. 

Supported by: Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Edward 
Mountain*, Paul Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Roz McCall*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09968 David Torrance: Dulux Kirkcaldy Supports Fife Deaf Club with Paint Donation—
That the Parliament applauds Kirkcaldy’s Dulux Decorator Centre after it supported Fife Deaf Club 
by providing the charity with £250 worth of paint, as well as free pre-mixed paint returned by 
customers, to help tackle redecorating its dilapidated base in the town; understands that staff from 
the painting and decorating hub came forward after reading about the club’s appeal in the Fife 
Free Press, and offered its support through the kind donation; considers that Dulux has been 
instrumental in helping community projects and charities over the years it has been in the Lang 
Toun; commends the company for its amazing show of community spirit, and wishes Dulux all the 
best for the future. 
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Supported by: Miles Briggs*, Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Paul Sweeney*, 
Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09967 David Torrance: Raith Rovers FC Fans Complete Million Step Challenge for 
Club's Charity—That the Parliament congratulates seven Raith Rovers FC fans on raising 
£1,400, by taking part in the Million Step Challenge in June 2023; recognises that the group, which 
was made up of Gavin Quinn, Gillian Eadie, Margie Robertson, George Fleming, Scott Wilson, 
Tracy English and David Watson, smashed its step count target by more than double in the 30 
days of the month by actually achieving a total of 2,314,498 steps between the participants; 
understands that the group's efforts raised £1,400 for the football club’s community foundation, a 
charitable organisation that uses the power of sport and the Raith brand to engage, motivate, 
inspire and empower the local community; commends the group for its efforts, and wishes the 
participants all the best for the future. 

Supported by: Jeremy Balfour*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar*, Edward Mountain*, Paul 
Sweeney*, Colin Beattie*, Bill Kidd*, Roz McCall*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

*S6M-09964 Kenneth Gibson: Memorial Honouring Nobel Prize Winner John Boyd Orr 
Unveiled in His Hometown of West Kilbride—That the Parliament recognises the new memorial 
unveiled in West Kilbride, and funded by West Kilbride Civic Society, to honour the Nobel Peace 
Prize winner, John Boyd Orr, who attended West Kilbride Public School; is aware that John Boyd 
Orr won the Nobel Prize in 1949 for his scientific research into nutrition and his work as the first 
Director-General of the United Nations Food and Agriculture Organisation, and donated the 
financial prize to the National Council, the World Movement for World Federal Government and 
other organisations devoted to peace and a united world government; recognises that Orr proved 
the value of milk being supplied to school children in 1927, leading to free school milk provision 
across the UK and, in 1936, released a report highlighting that at least one third of the UK 
population could not afford to buy sufficient food to provide a healthy diet; celebrates the work of 
John Boyd Orr, which included campaigning for the League of Nations to achieve an international 
policy on nutrition and asking the United States President, Franklin D Roosevelt, to consider 
launching a world food plan during the Second World War, believing that food and prosperity for all 
people on earth led to peace; congratulates and thanks West Kilbride Civic Society on the 
completion of this project, and wishes its members all the very best. 

Supported by: David Torrance*, Miles Briggs*, Audrey Nicoll*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, 
Annabelle Ewing*, Jeremy Balfour*, Stuart McMillan*, Paul Sweeney*, Roz McCall*, Evelyn 
Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

Motions and amendments which have attracted additional support 

S6M-09966 Michelle Thomson: John Rajczakowski Named Regional Award Winner for 
Carbon Monoxide Safety Video (lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Paul Sweeney*, Evelyn Tweed*, Bill Kidd*, David Torrance*, Audrey Nicoll*, Colin 
Beattie*, Miles Briggs*, Gillian Mackay*, Annabelle Ewing*, Jackie Dunbar* 

S6M-09963 Clare Adamson: Tour of Scotland Fundraiser (lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Beattie*, Miles Briggs*, Edward Mountain*, Annabelle Ewing*, Rona Mackay*, 
Paul Sweeney*, David Torrance*, Tess White*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Jeremy Balfour*, Gillian 
Mackay*, Roz McCall*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09967
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09964
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09966
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09963


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Motions | Gluasadan 

 

 
20 Monday 24 July 2023 

 

S6M-09962 Clare Adamson: SCIAF Emergency Appeal (lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Beattie*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Miles Briggs*, Clare Haughey*, Annabelle 
Ewing*, Rona Mackay*, Paul Sweeney*, Sarah Boyack*, David Torrance*, Tess White*, Mercedes 
Villalba*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Maggie Chapman*, Jeremy Balfour*, Gillian Mackay*, Evelyn 
Tweed*, Paul O'Kane*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09961 Clare Adamson: The Cherry Tree's Annual Fundraiser (lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Colin Beattie*, Annabelle Ewing*, Paul Sweeney*, Miles 
Briggs*, David Torrance*, Tess White*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Gillian Mackay*, Evelyn 
Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09960 Clare Adamson: New Age Fitness Fundraising Event for Maggie's Cancer Care 
Centre (lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Miles Briggs*, Colin Beattie*, Edward Mountain*, Annabelle Ewing*, Paul Sweeney*, 
David Torrance*, Tess White*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Jeremy Balfour*, Gillian Mackay*, 
Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09959 Gordon MacDonald: St Mark’s RC Primary School Ranked First in Edinburgh 
(lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Paul Sweeney*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Jackie Dunbar*, Colin Beattie*, Annabelle 
Ewing*, Bill Kidd*, Edward Mountain*, David Torrance*, Stuart McMillan*, Rona Mackay*, Jeremy 
Balfour*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09958 Stuart McMillan: Tonino’s Named Best Pizzeria in Scotland (lodged on 14 July 
2023) 

New Support: David Torrance*, Colin Beattie*, Annabelle Ewing*, Paul Sweeney*, Jackie Dunbar*, 
Bill Kidd*, Jeremy Balfour*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09957 Stuart McMillan: Link Housing Triple Success at Homes for Scotland Awards 
2023 (lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Paul Sweeney*, Tess White*, Jackie Dunbar*, Annabelle Ewing*, Bill Kidd*, Jeremy 
Balfour*, Evelyn Tweed*, Alexander Burnett* R, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09956 Meghan Gallacher: National Lottery Heritage Fund Grant Awarded to Our Past, 
My Future by Enable Scotland (lodged on 14 July 2023) 

New Support: Paul Sweeney* 

S6M-09955 Ivan McKee: Glasgow Saints FC Partnership with Openreach and Wolfson 
Brands (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Annabelle Ewing*, Audrey Nicoll*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, 
David Torrance*, Stuart McMillan*, Clare Haughey*, Colin Beattie*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jeremy 
Balfour*, Michelle Thomson*, Evelyn Tweed*, Bob Doris* 

S6M-09954 Stephanie Callaghan: Uddingston and Bellshill Project, Our Past, My Future, 
Awarded £237,514 from the National Lottery Heritage Fund (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Gillian Mackay*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 
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S6M-09953 Sandesh Gulhane: Thales Glasgow Wins £169 Million Contract to Build 
Periscopes for the Royal Navy's Dreadnought Submarines (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Meghan Gallacher*, Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander 
Burnett* 

S6M-09952 Paul Sweeney: Pride of Place at Provan Hall Project Awarded a Grant from the 
National Lottery Heritage Fund  (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09951 Paul O'Kane: Royal Alexandra Hospital Nurse Nominated for Nurse of the Year 
Award (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Gillian Mackay*, Sharon Dowey* 

S6M-09950 Pam Duncan-Glancy: Congratulating The Wise Group on Opening its New 
Service for People in Glasgow (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Sharon Dowey*, Paul O'Kane*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09949 Sandesh Gulhane: Ministry of Defence Gold Award for NHS Greater Glasgow 
and Clyde (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Pam Gosal*, Meghan Gallacher*, Maurice Golden*, Alexander 
Burnett* 

S6M-09948 Roz McCall: Dunfermline Charity Shop Launches Eco-friendly Living Range 
(lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Pam Gosal*, Maggie Chapman*, Meghan Gallacher*, Evelyn 
Tweed*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09947 Roz McCall: Pitreavie AAC Wins at Scottish Athletics Relay Championships 
(lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Pam Gosal*, Meghan Gallacher*, Maurice Golden*, Alexander 
Burnett* 

S6M-09946 Michelle Thomson: Alison Johnston Celebrates 26 Years of Service at 
Grangemouth Carers (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Tess White*, Jackie Dunbar*, Annabelle Ewing*, Bill Kidd*, Gillian Mackay*, Evelyn 
Tweed*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09945 Roz McCall: Owen Miller to Run for Team GB at Paris World Para Athletics 
Championships (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Meghan Gallacher*, Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander 
Burnett* 

S6M-09944 Michelle Thomson: Right Medicine Pharmacy is Pharmacy of the Year 2023 
(lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Tess White*, Jackie Dunbar*, Christine Grahame*, Annabelle Ewing*, Bill Kidd*, 
Gillian Mackay*, Evelyn Tweed*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 
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S6M-09942 Sandesh Gulhane: The Burrell Collection Wins Art Fund Museum of the Year 
2023 (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Maurice Golden*, Paul O'Kane*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09940 John Swinney: Congratulating Blairgowrie and Rattray Award Winners (lodged 
on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09939 Ben Macpherson: Team Scotland Playing in the Sacramento 2023 Homeless 
World Cup Tournament (lodged on 13 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Evelyn Tweed*, Brian Whittle*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09938 Finlay Carson: Three Peaks Challenge in Memory of David Hill (lodged on 12 July 
2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09937 Finlay Carson: Hugh McClymont Retires After 40 Years in the Dairy Industry 
(lodged on 12 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09936 Finlay Carson: Young Kirkcudbright Farmer Becomes First Recipient of 
Fordyce Maxwell Award (lodged on 12 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09935 Finlay Carson: Galloway and Southern Ayrshire Biosphere Gains UNESCO 
Status for Another 10 Years (lodged on 12 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09934 Finlay Carson: Relay for Life Event in Wigtown Raises £26,000 for Cancer 
Charity (lodged on 12 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09933 Jim Fairlie: Congratulating Logiealmond Estate on its Scottish Country Sports 
Tourism Award (lodged on 12 July 2023) 

New Support: Evelyn Tweed*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09932 Marie McNair: U16 St Peter the Apostle Football Team, in Clydebank, Wins the 
Glasgow Cup and the Glasgow League (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09931 Marie McNair: St Peter the Apostle High School, in Clydebank, Receives Gold 
Scottish Languages Employability Award (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09930 Clare Haughey: Strachan Craft Butchers Success at Scottish Independent Retail 
Awards 2023 (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 
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S6M-09929 Liam Kerr: Aberdeen-based Charity Absafe Awarded £103,191 Grant from UK 
Government (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman*, Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09928 Pam Gosal: Stitch the Gap CIC, Kirkintilloch, Receives £10,000 National Lottery 
Grant (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09927 Pam Gosal: New Roots Gardening Club, East Dunbartonshire, Receives £7,000 
National Lottery Grant (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09926 Pam Gosal: Bearsden & Milngavie Highland Games Association Receives 
£5,000 National Lottery Grant (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09925 Pam Gosal: Families of Auchinairn Coming Together Receives £3,000 National 
Lottery Grant (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle*, Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09924 Sandesh Gulhane: Partnership Between Glasgow Saints FC and Openreach  
(lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09923 Donald Cameron: Mary’s Meals Awarded Spanish Princess of Asturias Award 
for Concord (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09922 Clare Adamson: Father James Flynn, 50th Anniversary of Priestly Ordination 
(lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Paul O'Kane*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09921 Jeremy Balfour: Congratulating Fiona Bruce on Winning the People's Choice 
Award (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09919 Liz Smith: Alessia Palmieri Awarded British Tennis Development Coach of the 
Year (lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09918 Christine Grahame: The Tontine Hotel, Peebles, Awarded a Travellers' Choice 
Award by Tripadvisor (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09917 Jeremy Balfour: Congratulating Melissa Rowlands on Being Awarded the RCN 
Scotland Mental Health Nursing Award (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 
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S6M-09916 Paul Sweeney: Official Opening of the South City Way in Glasgow (lodged on 10 
July 2023) 

New Support: Paul O'Kane*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09915 Jeremy Balfour: National Schizophrenia Awareness Day 2023 (lodged on 10 July 
2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Maggie Chapman*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09914 Jackie Baillie: Royal Gun Salute Celebrates 800th Anniversary of Dumbarton 
(lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09913 Pam Gosal: Kirkintilloch Nurse Wins Royal College of Nursing Scotland Award 
(lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09912 Gordon MacDonald: Heriot-Watt, First University in Scotland to Achieve White 
Ribbon Status (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-09911 Alexander Burnett: RHASS Supports the Banchory Show and the Tarland Show 
(lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09910 Alexander Burnett: Aboyne Teenager Wins LitterLotto Prize (lodged on 10 July 
2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09909 Alexander Burnett: Balmoral Residents Receive Sir William Young Award 
(lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09908 Pauline McNeill: Openreach and Glasgow Saints FC Partnership  (lodged on 10 
July 2023) 

New Support: Tess White*, Bill Kidd*, Jeremy Balfour*, Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09907 Pam Gosal: Tullochan, Dumbarton, Receives £29,741 National Lottery Grant 
(lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09906 Pam Gosal: Linnvale Community Group, Clydebank, Receives £4,000 Grant 
from National Lottery (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09905 Pam Gosal: Kinship Care, Clydebank, Receives £8,600 Grant from National 
Lottery (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 
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S6M-09904 Pam Gosal: Golden Friendships Clydebank Receives £10,000 National Lottery 
Grant (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09903 Pam Gosal: Clydebank-based Charity, Firecloud, Receives £9,880 Grant from 
the National Lottery (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09902 Pam Gosal: Clydebank District Choir Receives £5,950 Grant from the National 
Lottery (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09901 Pam Gosal: Carers of West Dunbartonshire Receives £142,875 Grant from the 
National Lottery (lodged on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09900 Pam Gosal: Alternatives West Dunbartonshire Receives £10,000 Grant (lodged 
on 10 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09899 Liz Smith: Abercairny Estates Wins Estates Challenges Competition (lodged on 
07 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09898 Michelle Thomson: Stenhouse Performing Arts Selected to Compete at Dance 
World Cup 2023 (lodged on 07 July 2023) 

New Support: Gillian Mackay*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09896 Pam Duncan-Glancy: Celebrating Glasgow North West Citizens Advice Bureau 
on its 40th Anniversary (lodged on 07 July 2023) 

New Support: Paul O'Kane*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09894 Kaukab Stewart: Vongayi Mufara Wins Trustee of the Year (lodged on 07 July 
2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-09893 Douglas Lumsden: James N’Dow Awarded St Peter’s Medal (lodged on 07 July 
2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09892 Liam McArthur: 79th Sitting of the Scottish Youth Parliament (lodged on 07 July 
2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Maggie Chapman*, Brian Whittle*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09891 Gillian Mackay: Strathcarron Hospice Shop in Stenhousemuir (lodged on 07 July 
2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 
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S6M-09889 Keith Brown: Alloa Academy Pupils Win 2023 Young Pathfinders Climate Award 
(lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-09885 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Skye and Lochalsh Mental Health Association 
Celebrates 30 Years (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09884 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Caithness Cowboy Jim Campbell, Founding Member of 
Radio Skye, Retires After Three Decades (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09883 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Bikeathon Celebrates 30th Anniversary (lodged on 06 
July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09882 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Nicola Moar Appointed as Orkney's First ARCHIE Child 
Bereavement Responder (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09881 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Medallist of the Order of the British Empire (lodged on 
06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09880 Jamie Halcro Johnston: William Gerald Gray Appointed Member of the Order of 
the British Empire (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09879 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Cathy Shaw Appointed Member of the Order of the 
British Empire (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09878 Jamie Halcro Johnston: Lord-Lieutenant Bobby Hunter Appointed Commander 
of the Order of the British Empire (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09877 Sarah Boyack: Melissa Rowlands Wins RCN Scotland Mental Health Nursing 
Award (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09876 Sarah Boyack: Fiona Bruce Wins People’s Choice Award for Cancer Care 
(lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09875 Neil Bibby: RCN Scotland Nurse of the Year Awards (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 
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S6M-09874 Jackie Dunbar: Aberdeen Man Runs 100 Miles for Charlie’s House (lodged on 05 
July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09873 Jackie Baillie: Loch Lomond Distillery, World Spirits Competition in the United 
States (lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Alexander Burnett*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09872 Jackie Baillie: Charities Benefit from More than £1,500 of Funding from the 
Asda Foundation (lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09871 David Torrance: LinkLiving Wins TPAS Best Practice Champion of the Year 
Award (lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09870 David Torrance: Kirkcaldy Art Club's Clay Creatures Raise Money for Family 
Support Charity (lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09869 David Torrance: Long Service Awards for Members of Fife Am-dram Company 
(lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09868 David Torrance: Kirkcaldy High School Pupil Receives Educate to Lead Award 
from Soroptimists (lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09867 Roz McCall: Dunfermline Slot Car Racing Club Receives Asda Donation (lodged 
on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Maurice Golden*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09866 Clare Adamson: Fundraiser in Memory of Alexander McCrae (lodged on 05 July 
2023) 

New Support: Gillian Mackay*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09865 Clare Adamson: Quit Your Way Team Knits Blankets for Dogs Trust (lodged on 
05 July 2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-09864 Clare Adamson: Angus Irvine Wins Prestigious Atlas Running Belfast 100-mile 
Race (lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09862 Clare Adamson: Recycle a Bicycle Initiative (lodged on 05 July 2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman*, Alexander Burnett* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09874
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09873
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09869
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09868
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S6M-09861 Clare Adamson: One Million Step Challenge for Diabetes UK (lodged on 05 July 
2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09860 Kevin Stewart: Aberdeen Race for Life (lodged on 06 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Karen Adam* 

S6M-09859 Michelle Thomson: Day Today, Stenhousemuir, Secures Category Star at 
Independent Achievers Academy Awards (lodged on 04 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09858 Michelle Thomson: Bo'ness United Community Football Club Girls Team 
Competes at Coalfields Regeneration Trust’s Home Internationals 2023 (lodged on 04 July 
2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09856 Rhoda Grant: Scapa Flow Museum Shortlisted for Art Fund Museum of the Year 
(lodged on 04 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09855 David Torrance: Ruth Carson Receives The Queen’s Scout Award to Complete 
Treble of Scouting Awards (lodged on 04 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09854 Foysol Choudhury: Diversified Wins Charity of the Year (lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09853 Emma Harper: Saltire Society Announces Inaugural 40 Under 40 List (lodged on 
03 July 2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman* 

S6M-09852 Sandesh Gulhane: New Emission-free Buses in Glasgow (lodged on 03 July 
2023) 

New Support: Maggie Chapman*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09851 Martin Whitfield: Prestonpans Civic Square Scottish Design Awards (lodged on 
03 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09850 Ben Macpherson: Community Action Award Won by Fresh Start Scotland 
(lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09849 Donald Cameron: The Oban Times' Invest in the West Campaign (lodged on 03 
July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09861
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09860
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09849


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Motions | Gluasadan 

 

 
29 Monday 24 July 2023 

 

S6M-09848 Douglas Lumsden: The Flying Scotsman’s Centenary and Journey to Aberdeen 
(lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09847 Liam McArthur: Unigarth Evangeline Best Shetland Pony at Royal Highland 
Show (lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09846 Evelyn Tweed: West Moss-side Organic Farm Wins Sustainable Small Farm of 
the Year (lodged on 04 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Stewart*, David Torrance*, Audrey Nicoll*, Kenneth Gibson*, Bill Kidd*, 
Colin Beattie*, Annabelle Ewing*, Stephanie Callaghan*, Jackie Dunbar*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09845 Jackie Baillie: More than £90,000 Raised by Friends of Loch Lomond and The 
Trossachs (lodged on 04 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09844 Kenneth Gibson: Professor Scott Bryson Completes 10x10 Challenge for MND 
Scotland (lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09843 Jim Fairlie: Bushcraft Bairns Wins Scotland’s Finest Woods Early Years Award 
(lodged on 11 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal*, Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09841 Jackie Baillie: Helensburgh’s Tennis Star, Gordon Reid, Wins 17th Grand Slam 
Doubles Title After Being Awarded an OBE (lodged on 04 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09840 Michelle Thomson: Primary School Pupils from Bo’ness Score Local Success in 
Play for Jay Football Tournament (lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09839 Evelyn Tweed: Two Sea Lion Pups Born at Blairdrummond Safari Park (lodged 
on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: James Dornan*, Rona Mackay*, David Torrance*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Miles 
Briggs*, Annabelle Ewing*, Tess White*, Audrey Nicoll*, Jackie Dunbar*, Bill Kidd*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09838 Kenneth Gibson: Carlton B&B Seamill Named the Best in Scotland (lodged on 03 
July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09837 Michelle Thomson: McKechnie School of Dance and Performing Arts Set for the 
Dance World Cup 2023 (lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09848
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http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09841
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09840
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09839
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09838
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09837


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Motions | Gluasadan 

 

 
30 Monday 24 July 2023 

 

S6M-09836 Evelyn Tweed: Strathblane Primary School Under-11 Lacrosse Team Wins 
British Championships (lodged on 03 July 2023) 

New Support: Pam Duncan-Glancy*, James Dornan*, Miles Briggs*, David Torrance*, Annabelle 
Ewing*, Tess White*, Jackie Dunbar*, Audrey Nicoll*, Bill Kidd*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09833 Sandesh Gulhane: Glasgow and Aberdeen Announced as UK Investment Zones  
(lodged on 30 June 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09830 Sharon Dowey: Ayr’s Chloe McRoberts Receives First Class Honours Degree 
(lodged on 30 June 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09826 Jackie Dunbar: National Lottery Community Fund Awards Over £58,000 to 
Aberdeen Action On Disability’s "Helpability" Project (lodged on 30 June 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett*, Karen Adam* 

S6M-09825 Karen Adam: Inner Wheel Club of Banff Raises £1,500 for Scotland's Charity Air 
Ambulance (SCAA) (lodged on 30 June 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09805 Pam Duncan-Glancy: Glasgow Children’s Hospital Charity Wins People’s 
Choice Award (lodged on 29 June 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09795 Finlay Carson: Dumfries and Galloway Youth Work Project Wins National Award 
(lodged on 29 June 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth* 

S6M-09788 Finlay Carson: Youth Beatz Music Festival (lodged on 29 June 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth* 

S6M-09774 Donald Cameron: Celebrating the Declaration of Arbroath  (lodged on 28 June 
2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09715 Gillian Mackay: Scottish Young Carers Festival 2023 (lodged on 27 June 2023) 

New Support: Miles Briggs*, Audrey Nicoll*, Ross Greer*, Jackie Dunbar*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09714 Claire Baker: Impact of Plans for Scottish Fire and Rescue Service in Mid 
Scotland and Fife (lodged on 27 June 2023) 

New Support: Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09707 Neil Bibby: Jackie Green (lodged on 29 June 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*, Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09696 Pam Duncan-Glancy: City of Glasgow College Cuts (lodged on 26 June 2023) 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09836
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09833
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New Support: Paul O'Kane* 

S6M-09644 Mercedes Villalba: Remembering Piper Alpha  (lodged on 22 June 2023) 

New Support: Alexander Burnett* 

S6M-09637 Willie Rennie: Withdrawal from the Energy Charter Treaty (lodged on 22 June 
2023) 

New Support: Ariane Burgess* 

S6M-09635 Rachael Hamilton: Celebrating UK Armed Forces Day (lodged on 21 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09604 Pam Gosal: Asda Foundation Awards Grants Across West Scotland (lodged on 
21 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09596 Edward Mountain: Calman Trust Ltd Awarded £138,000 from the National 
Lottery Community Fund (lodged on 21 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09593 Alexander Stewart: Medallist of the Order of the British Empire (lodged on 21 
June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09592 Alexander Stewart: Member of the Order of the British Empire (lodged on 21 June 
2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09591 Alexander Stewart: Commander of the Order of the British Empire (lodged on 21 
June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09571 Tess White: Macphie Ltd is Finalist at North East Scotland Food and Drink 
Awards 2023 (lodged on 19 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09570 Tess White: Mearns Marmalade is Finalist at North East Scotland Food and 
Drink Awards 2023 (lodged on 19 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09569 Tess White: Burnside Brewery Wins Best Brewed Product at North East 
Scotland Food and Drink Awards 2023 (lodged on 19 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09568 Tess White: Stonehaven Sea Salt Co is Finalist at North East Scotland Food 
And Drink Awards 2023 (lodged on 19 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09644
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S6M-09567 Tess White: Mearns Chilli Farm is Finalist at North East Scotland Food And 
Drink Awards 2023 (lodged on 20 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09565 Alexander Burnett: Aberdeenshire West Groups Receive Grants from National 
Lottery Community Fund (lodged on 16 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09540 Pam Gosal: St Peter the Apostle High School Pupils Win Two Prizes at the 
COPFS Public Speaking Competition (lodged on 16 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09535 Rachael Hamilton: Coldstream Museum Honouring D-Day Tactician Opens 
(lodged on 20 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09534 Rachael Hamilton: Kelso Hosts Inspire Learning Festival (lodged on 16 June 
2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09481 Alexander Stewart: National Lottery Award for Home-Start Clackmannanshire in 
Mid Scotland and Fife Region (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09480 Alexander Stewart: National Lottery Award for HSTAR Scotland in Mid Scotland 
and Fife Region (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09479 Alexander Stewart: National Lottery Award for Menstrie Community Action 
Group in Mid Scotland and Fife Region (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09478 Alexander Stewart: National Lottery Award for Pathways To Employment in Mid 
Scotland and Fife Region (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09477 Alexander Stewart: National Lottery Award for Play Alloa in Mid Scotland and 
Fife Region (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09475 Alexander Stewart: National Lottery Award for Sauchie Active8 in Mid Scotland 
and Fife Region (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09474 Alexander Stewart: National Lottery Award for Support for Families in Mid 
Scotland and Fife Region (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09567
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S6M-09472 Alexander Stewart: Town Break SCIO Receives £200,000 of National Lottery 
Funding (lodged on 15 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09464 Craig Hoy: Congratulations to the East Lothian Senior String Ensemble for 
Winning the Scottish Young Musicians Ensemble of the Year 2023 (lodged on 14 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09444 Alexander Stewart: Injury Awareness Week 2023 (lodged on 14 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09426 Clare Adamson: 29th Lanarkshire Business Excellence Awards (lodged on 14 
June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09425 Clare Adamson: Firefighters Take on the Three Peaks Challenge (lodged on 13 
June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09424 Clare Adamson: New College Lanarkshire Scoops Top Awards (lodged on 13 
June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09423 Clare Adamson: Kayden Croken Makes it to the Scottish Singles Bowls 
Championship (lodged on 13 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09419 Marie McNair: Alexander's Bar Dominos Club in Clydebank Wins the Clydebank 
and District Dominos League  (lodged on 13 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09418 Russell Findlay: Publication of 16 Incle Street  (lodged on 14 June 2023) 

New Support: Brian Whittle* 

S6M-09412 Stuart McMillan: Inverclyde Organisations Benefit from £250,000 National 
Lottery Fund Awards (lodged on 13 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09394 Evelyn Tweed: East Plean Primary School Wins Scottish Education Awards 
2023 (lodged on 13 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09392 Annabelle Ewing: 96-mile West Highland Way Fundraiser in 48 Hours for Andy’s 
Man Club  (lodged on 13 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09386 Jim Fairlie: Nancy Barron's Fundraising Efforts (lodged on 13 June 2023) 
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New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09377 Alex Cole-Hamilton: Cystic Fibrosis Week 2023 (lodged on 13 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09373 Clare Adamson: Raymond Murphy Runs London Marathon to Raise Funds for 
St Andrew's Hospice (lodged on 14 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09368 Katy Clark: Wemyss Bay Railway Station  (lodged on 13 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09366 Liam McArthur: Orkney Netball Takes Home Evelyn Beattie Quaich (lodged on 13 
June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09358 Liam McArthur: Orkney Regains Junior Inter-County Title (lodged on 12 June 
2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09355 Gillian Mackay: Faye Taylor’s Memorial Garden in Berryhill Primary (lodged on 
12 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09334 Bill Kidd: Congratulations to ANYiSO (lodged on 08 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09333 John Swinney: Recognising Aberfeldy and District Rotary Club's Charity 
Concert Success (lodged on 08 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09326 Mercedes Villalba: Congratulating Fans Supporting Foodbanks Dundee on 
Raising £10,000 for Lochee Larder (lodged on 08 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09319 Clare Adamson: Commending the "Weans" of Rannoch Drive for Goalpost 
Fundraising (lodged on 08 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09312 Sarah Boyack: Launch of Documentary Film, When the Words Away Went 
(lodged on 08 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09307 Marie McNair: Young Businesswoman from Clydebank Wins Rising Star Award 
(lodged on 08 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 
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S6M-09274 Jackie Dunbar: Aberdeen Teen Boxer Wins Gold at Finland Boxing Tournament 
(lodged on 07 June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09269 James Dornan: Congratulations to St Fillan's Volunteers  (lodged on 12 June 
2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09230 Ariane Burgess: Celebrating Scotland's Caledonian Pinewoods (lodged on 06 
June 2023) 

New Support: Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09116 Alex Cole-Hamilton: Congratulations to David Leggat MBE (lodged on 14 June 
2023) 

New Support: Alexander Stewart*, Pam Duncan-Glancy*, Colin Beattie*, Liz Smith*, Bill Kidd*, 
Edward Mountain*, Miles Briggs*, Martin Whitfield*, Jeremy Balfour*, Murdo Fraser*, Pam Gosal* 

S6M-09058 Brian Whittle: Killie Heartmates Celebrate 25 Years (lodged on 19 May 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth* 

S6M-09038 Alexander Stewart: War Graves Week 2023 (lodged on 18 May 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth* 

S6M-08978 Claire Baker: The Future of Queen Margaret Hospice in Dunfermline  (lodged on 
18 May 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth* 

S6M-08949 Alex Cole-Hamilton: Sewage Crisis in Scotland (lodged on 18 May 2023) 

New Support: Colin Smyth*

http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09274
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09269
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09230
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09116
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09058
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-09038
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-08978
http://www.parliament.scot/parliamentarybusiness/28877.aspx?SearchType=Advance&ReferenceNumbers=S6M-08949


Today's Business 
Gnothaichean an-diugh 

Future Business 
Gnothaichean ri teachd 

Motions & Questions 
Gluasadan agus Ceistean 

Legislation 
Reachdas 

Other 
Eile 

Questions | Ceistean 

 

 
36 Monday 24 July 2023 

 

Written Questions 

Questions in which a member has indicated a declarable interest are marked with an "R". 

Government Initiated Questions are initiated by the parliament Government in order to 
facilitate the provision of information to the Parliament. 

Government initiated questions lodged from 17 July 2023 to 21 July 2023 

S6W-20039 Ben Macpherson: To ask the Scottish Government how it will progress its 
commitment to work with local government and other partners to reduce the number of people 
living in temporary accommodation. 
S6W-20127 Alasdair Allan: To ask the Scottish Government how it plans to develop a 
sustainable, diverse, competitive and economically viable aquaculture industry. 
 

Written questions lodged from 17 July 2023 to 21 July 2023 

S6W-19915 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government what its response is to the opinion of 
Lord Young, following a hearing at the Court of Session, that Circularity Scotland acted unlawfully 
in setting the return handling fee for the Deposit Return Scheme. 
S6W-19960 Foysol Choudhury: To ask the Scottish Government for what reason patients who 
required an interpreter were not included in the process to form a patient panel on chronic pain.  
S6W-19961 Paul Sweeney: To ask the Scottish Government what its position is on whether there 
should be an agreed standard for the wearing by Police Scotland of dress uniforms for passing out 
parades at the Scottish Police College and for high-profile public events, and whether it can 
instruct the Chief Constable of Police Scotland to adopt such a standard, in light of such policies 
reportedly being adopted by other police forces in the UK. 
S6W-19962 Paul Sweeney: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will instruct Scottish 
Water to address any defects with the (a) structural condition, (b) external paintwork and (c) 
architectural lighting installations at the (i) Cranhill, (ii) Craigend and (iii) Garthamlock water 
towers. 
S6W-19963 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Fife, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19964 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Fife, and what the 
revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19965 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Fife, and how this compares to the targets 
set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19966 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, as committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Fife. 
S6W-19967 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee Phase 1, and what the revised cost is as of 30 
June 2023. 
S6W-19968 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee 
Phase 1, and what the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
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S6W-19969 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee Phase 1, and how this 
compares to the targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19970 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee Phase 1. 
S6W-19971 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Highland, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19972 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Highland, and what 
the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19973 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Highland, and how this compares to the 
targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19974 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Highland. 
S6W-19975 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Forth Valley, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19976 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Forth Valley, and 
what the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19977 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Forth Valley, and how this compares to the 
targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19978 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Forth Valley. 
S6W-19979 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee Phase 2, and what the revised cost is as of 30 
June 2023. 
S6W-19980 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee 
Phase 2, and what the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19981 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee Phase 2, and how this 
compares to the targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19982 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Golden Jubilee Phase 2. 
S6W-19983 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Ayrshire and Arran, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 
2023. 
S6W-19984 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Ayrshire and Arran, 
and what the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19985 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Ayrshire and Arran, and how this compares 
to the targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
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S6W-19986 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Ayrshire and Arran. 
S6W-19987 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Tayside, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19988 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Tayside, and what 
the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19989 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Tayside, and how this compares to the 
targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19990 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Tayside. 
S6W-19991 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Lothian, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19992 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Lothian, and what 
the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19993 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Lothian, and how this compares to the 
targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19994 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Lothian. 
S6W-19995 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Lanarkshire, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19996 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Lanarkshire, and 
what the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-19997 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Lanarkshire, and how this compares to the 
targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-19998 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Lanarkshire. 
S6W-19999 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned National Treatment Centre Grampian, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-20000 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned National Treatment Centre Grampian, and what 
the revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-20001 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the National Treatment Centre Grampian, and how this compares to the 
targets set out in its NHS Recovery Plan. 
S6W-20002 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government how many of the 1,500 new clinical 
and non-clinical staff, committed to in its NHS Recovery Plan, will be based in the National 
Treatment Centre Grampian. 
S6W-20003 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original cost was for the 
planned new Edinburgh Eye Pavilion, and what the revised cost is as of 30 June 2023. 
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S6W-20004 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the original timetable was for 
the (a) completion and (b) opening of the planned new Edinburgh Eye Pavilion, and what the 
revised timetable is as of 30 June 2023. 
S6W-20005 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what the revised number of patients 
is that will be treated in the planned new Edinburgh Eye Pavilion, and how this compares to its 
original targets. 
S6W-20006 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether any consultation has taken 
place regarding increasing the connectivity between Ayr and Stranraer railway stations and the 
Cairnryan ferry terminal, for the purposes of increasing passenger traffic on journeys between 
Scotland and Northern Ireland. 
S6W-20007 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether ScotRail Holdings has any 
plans to expand the offering of "Rail and Sail" tickets between Scotland and Northern Ireland. 
S6W-20008 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether (a) Transport Scotland and 
(b) ScotRail Holdings has entered negotiations with Stena Line on increasing the availability of 
"Rail and Sail" tickets between Edinburgh, Glasgow and Belfast. 
S6W-20009 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether (a) Transport Scotland and 
(b) ScotRail Holdings has modelled the potential reduction in carbon emissions from a modal shift 
on journeys between Edinburgh, Glasgow and Belfast.   
S6W-20011 Liam McArthur: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide a breakdown 
of spending on the Road Equivalent Tariff, by (a) route and (b) carrier, in each year since it was 
introduced. 
S6W-20012 Liam McArthur: To ask the Scottish Government how much capital spending was 
allocated to each local authority in each of the last 10 years. 
S6W-20013 Daniel Johnson: To ask the Scottish Government what active strategies it has in 
place to reduce roads deaths, and what evaluation has been carried out into the effectiveness of 
any such strategies.  
S6W-20014 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government what consultation was undertaken, 
and with whom, before the decision was made to stop providing standalone loan funding for solar 
PV and storage systems through Home Energy Scotland on 27 June 2023. 
S6W-20015 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether it has met with any former 
employees of Circularity Scotland, following the organisation going in to administration. 
S6W-20016 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of Circularity Scotland going 
in to administration, whether it has met with any former (a) suppliers and (b) contractors of the 
firm. 
S6W-20017 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government what discussions it has had with the 
UK Government regarding Circularity Scotland going into administration. 
S6W-20018 Alexander Burnett: To ask the Scottish Government by what date its reported new 
£1 million Autism Support Fund will be launched by Inspiring Scotland. 
S6W-20019 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government how many schools have a 
dedicated car park for staff, (a) in total and (b) broken down by local authority.  
S6W-20020 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government how many new schools are 
currently planned to be built, broken down by local authority.  
S6W-20021 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government how many schools have been 
built, from 2017 to date, broken down by local authority. 
S6W-20022 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government how many schools have been 
identified as containing asbestos, from 2015 to date, (a) in total and (b) broken down by local 
authority. 
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S6W-20023 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government what the total current overspend 
costs are on building new (a) schools and (b) nursery buildings, broken down by local authority 
area. 
S6W-20024 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government how many schools have been 
substantially refurbished, from 2016-17 to date, (a) in total and (b) broken down by local authority. 
S6W-20025 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government how many schools were in good 
or satisfactory condition, from 2016-17 to date, (a) in total and (b) broken down by local authority.  
S6W-20026 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government what assessment it has made of 
the number of school buildings that currently pose a risk to life, (a) in total and (b) broken down by 
local authority.  
S6W-20027 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government what the cost was of using 
external designers for school building projects, from 2016-17 to date, (a) in total and (b) broken 
down by local authority.  
S6W-20028 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government what proportion of school 
buildings are currently believed to be past their estimated initial design life, which could be 
extended with adequate maintenance, broken down by local authority.  
S6W-20029 Martin Whitfield: To ask the Scottish Government how many pupils are currently 
learning in a school that requires major rebuilding or refurbishment, broken down by local 
authority.  
S6W-20030 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what it is doing to ensure that 
care experienced young people are aware of their legal rights and have access to independent 
legal representation. 
S6W-20031 Willie Rennie: To ask the Scottish Government what funding is available for 
homeowners or landlords of properties that have heat pumps installed, and who want to maximise 
the decarbonisation of their properties and decrease their energy bills by installing solar PV and 
battery storage systems. 
S6W-20033 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update 
on when the full results of the Scottish Census 2022 will be published. 
S6W-20034 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government what initial expectation there was 
to use administrative data sources in the compilation of the Scottish Census 2022 results, and 
what the actual use of administrative data sources was. 
S6W-20035 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government how many administrative data 
sources were relied upon in the compilation of the Scottish Census (a) 2011 and (b) 2022 results. 
S6W-20036 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can provide an 
estimate of any increased risk of error as a result of any increased use of administrative data 
sources in the compilation of the Scottish Census 2022 results. 
S6W-20037 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government what plans it has to carry out a 
review of the (a) location of, (b) staffing of and (c) funding allocated to its international offices. 
S6W-20038 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government what plans it has to "publish an 
Annual Report setting out the contribution made by [its] international offices to promoting the 
values, objectives and priorities of the revised International Framework", as recommended by the 
Constitution, Europe, External Affairs and Culture Committee in its report, Inquiry into the Scottish 
Government’s International Work.  
S6W-20040 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government what support it provides to 
homeowners who are dissatisfied with their property factor. 
S6W-20041 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether its proposed Housing Bill 
will make any provisions regarding property factors. 
S6W-20042 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether it has any plans to amend 
legislation covering the operation of property factors. 
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S6W-20043 Paul Sweeney: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will consider making an 
offer to the Commonwealth Games Federation for Glasgow to host the 2026 Commonwealth 
Games, in light of the withdrawal of the Australian state of Victoria as hosts. 
S6W-20044 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government what funding it (a) has provided and (b) 
will provide for any remedial action in relation to reinforced autoclaved aerated concrete in school 
buildings 
S6W-20046 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government when it last carried out risk assessments 
on each school building for which it is responsible and that contains reinforced autoclaved aerated 
concrete; whether it has published the outcomes of any such assessments, and if this is not the 
case, whether it plans to do so, and how regularly any such assessments will take place in the 
future.  
S6W-20047 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government, in each case where a risk assessment 
has been carried out of school buildings that contain reinforced autoclaved aerated concrete, 
whether any recommendations made as part of the assessment have been undertaken and 
completed, and if this is not the case, what the reasons are for this not having been done.  
S6W-20048 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government whether it has published all minutes of 
any discussions that relevant ministers have had with (a) officials and (b) local authorities 
regarding the issue of reinforced autoclaved aerated concrete in school buildings. 
S6W-20049 Daniel Johnson: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update 
on the integration of the Skills 4.0 model into work-based learning and the broader skills and 
education systems.  
S6W-20050 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what information it holds on 
how many Ukrainians, who received visas through the Super Sponsor Scheme, arrived in the UK 
but never came to Scotland or registered with a Scottish local authority.  
S6W-20051 Daniel Johnson: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide a 
breakdown of its Skills and Training budget detailing (a) resources committed per programme, (b) 
staffing costs and (c) capital costs in each of the last five years.  
S6W-20052 Daniel Johnson: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide a 
breakdown of the number of (a) graduate, (b) foundation and (c) modern apprenticeships by (i) 
occupational grouping and (ii) employer size in each of the last five years.   
S6W-20053 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-19222 by Lorna Slater on 18 July 2023, whether it will specify the mechanisms that it has in 
place to assess and monitor the "range of risks relating to the delivery of the Deposit Return 
Scheme".  
S6W-20054 Douglas Ross: To ask the Scottish Government for what reason the archive for data, 
information and research for the Scottish Drug Deaths Taskforce is only available through secure 
gateways. 
S6W-20055 Douglas Ross: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answers to questions 
S6W-18904 and S6W-18890 by Elena Whitham on 22 June and 26 June 2023 respectively, given 
that £431,988 was the total funding for social media, billboards, print media and radio for the "How 
to Save a Life" campaign, and that the £800,000 allocated for media campaigns in 2021 and 2022 
on the use of naloxone has been fully spent on that campaign, whether it will provide a breakdown 
of how the remaining £360,012 was spent. 
S6W-20056 Douglas Ross: To ask the Scottish Government what research studies have been 
commissioned by the Scottish Drug Deaths Taskforce, and whether it will provide a full breakdown 
of any such studies, including which organisation each study was allocated to and the costs of 
each study. 
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S6W-20057 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6W-19560 by Lorna Slater on 18 July 2023, on what specific date the Scottish Government first 
informed the UK Government that Circularity Scotland was likely to go into administration.  
S6W-20058 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to S6W-19560 
by Lorna Slater on 18 July 2023, on what date it began to assume that Circularity Scotland was 
likely to go into administration.  
S6W-20059 Beatrice Wishart: To ask the Scottish Government for what reason Scottish 
Government funding for the charity Autism Understanding Scotland for 2023-24 has reportedly 
been delayed, and when the charity will receive its funding for 2023-24. 
S6W-20060 Beatrice Wishart: To ask the Scottish Government what fund it has used in previous 
years to provide funding for the charity Autism Understanding Scotland.  
S6W-20062 Carol Mochan: To ask the Scottish Government what measures it considers when 
taking a decision on whether to override an existing local authority decision refusing planning 
permission for a wind farm development, or aspects of such a development. 
S6W-20063 Carol Mochan: To ask the Scottish Government what it considers to be an 
acceptable distance between existing residences and wind farm developments, and what its 
position is on whether the number of separate wind farms in proximity to a residential area should 
be taken into account when judging the suitability of a new wind farm development. 
S6W-20064 Alexander Burnett: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an 
update on any plans it has to provide funding for post-diagnostic services for children and young 
people with autism. 
S6W-20065 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government what mechanisms teachers can utilise to 
officially raise concerns about pupils who are persistently absent from school without explanation; 
whether a system for raising such concerns exists in Scotland that is similar to the Early Help 
Scheme in England; how many cases of persistent absence of pupils from school have been 
reported by teachers in the last five years, and in what proportion of any such cases was action 
taken, broken down by year and local authority area. 
S6W-20066 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government how many out-of-catchment applications 
have been submitted for pupils in (a) primary and (b) secondary schools in the last five years, and 
what proportion of these applications were successful, broken down by year and local authority 
area.  
S6W-20067 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government how many children were home-schooled 
in each year since 2016-17, broken down by local authority area. 
S6W-20068 Liam Kerr: To ask the Scottish Government how many pupils were recorded as (a) 
persistently and (b) severely absent in (i) primary and (ii) secondary schools in the last five years, 
broken down by year and local authority area. 
S6W-20069 Paul Sweeney: To ask the Scottish Government what specific action it is taking to 
grow international route development at Glasgow Airport. 
S6W-20070 Paul Sweeney: To ask the Scottish Government what engagement it has had with (a) 
AGS Airports Limited and (b) International Airlines Group, regarding the proposed expansion of 
British Airways Maintenance Glasgow (BAMG) through the construction of a new hangar facility to 
undertake maintenance, repair and overhaul (MRO) of the entire narrow-body aircraft fleet across 
the International Airlines Group. 
S6W-20071 Daniel Johnson: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide a full list of 
employers that have at least one employee currently undertaking a graduate apprenticeship.  
S6W-20072 Rachael Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what progress it is making 
towards meeting its reported commitment to enhance the Forestry Grant Scheme to deliver 
improved support for tree planting around rivers and streams, and when it expects to make any 
announcement on this matter. 
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S6W-20073 Rachael Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of the British Veterinary 
Association's reported concern that the new Scottish Veterinary Service will create a different 
regime in Scotland, what steps it has taken to ensure interoperability. 
S6W-20074 Rachael Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what consideration it has given 
to any implications of potentially differing regulatory regimes for the new Scottish Veterinary 
Service, compared to the regime currently in place, particularly in light of the United Kingdom 
Internal Market Act 2020. 
S6W-20075 Rachael Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government, regarding the proposed Scottish 
Veterinary Service, what discussions it has had with the UK Government to avoid any potential 
breach of the United Kingdom Internal Market Act 2020. 
S6W-20078 Rachael Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government how the proposed Scottish 
Veterinary Service would be funded, in terms of direct taxpayer support, and what assessment it 
has made of how much this would take from existing Scottish Government funds, in light of its 
position that it is operating under severe financial pressure. 
S6W-20082 Rachael Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government what evaluation has been made 
of the current launch timetable for the Scottish Veterinary Service. 
S6W-20084 Liam McArthur: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update on 
discussions it has had with the UK Government regarding the introduction of Road Equivalent 
Tariff on ferry routes across the Pentland Firth. 
S6W-20086 Alex Cole-Hamilton: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to 
question S6W-19682 by Joe Fitzpatrick on 19 July 2023, which local authority has asked for 
financial support. 
S6W-20088 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government what progress is being made in 
relation to the work of the Climate Change Plan Advisory Group (CCPAG) and what policy 
outcomes can be reported as a result of the input from the CCPAG.  
S6W-20089 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government how its Climate Change Plan 
Advisory Group’s policy outcomes will be reported on. 
S6W-20092 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will publish the 
stakeholder responses to its public consultation on the draft Energy Strategy and Just Transition 
Plan, and, if so, when it will do so.  
S6W-20094 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of the response from the 
Minister for Just Transition, Employment and Fair Work to the chair of the Just Transition 
Commission on 28 March 2023, which was published on 14 April 2023, whether it will publish 
further detail regarding the outstanding work required to deliver decarbonisation of one million 
homes by 2030, particularly in relation to (a) financing, (b) skills and (c) workforce capacity. 
S6W-20095 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of its announcement of the 
successful projects for year one, whether it will provide further detail on the allocation of the Just 
Transition Fund to ensure transparency and value for money.  
S6W-20096 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government what work it is undertaking to roll out 
initiatives similar to the Just Transition Fund, which is primarily focused in the north east and 
Moray, for communities across Scotland.  
S6W-20097 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of the definition of "green 
jobs" published by the Office for National Statistics, whether it will provide further detail on the 
allocation of its £100 million Green Jobs Fund, including the (a) amount already allocated and (b) 
outcomes to date. 
S6W-20099 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update on 
the Green Growth Accelerator programme, including how much of the £200 million public sector 
investment has already been allocated.  
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S6W-20100 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government how much private sector investment 
has been secured, to date, for Scotland’s transition to net zero, as part of the Green Growth 
Accelerator programme. 
S6W-20101 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government when it will provide a detailed 
response to each of the 15 recommendations of the independent review of the skills delivery 
landscape. 
S6W-20103 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update on 
what work it is undertaking to incorporate the 10 demands of offshore oil and gas workers for a 
just transition, as laid out in the report, Our Power: Offshore workers’ demands for a just energy 
transition, published in March 2023 by Friends of the Earth Scotland and the Platform collective, 
and which have reportedly been backed by over 90% of over 1,000 workers surveyed. 
S6W-20104 Sarah Boyack: To ask the Scottish Government what steps it is taking to remove any 
barriers that make it harder for oil and gas workers to move into the renewables industry, including 
in relation to how to effectively communicate with local communities that may not be familiar with 
concepts used in policy-making, such as just transition or climate justice. 
S6W-20105 Ariane Burgess: To ask the Scottish Government whether it plans to ask NatureScot 
to conduct a review of licences for the lethal control of beavers to ascertain whether such licences 
are required or whether translocation could be implemented instead, in line with its commitment to 
expand Scotland's beaver population, announced in November 2021. 
S6W-20106 Ariane Burgess: To ask the Scottish Government what powers NatureScot has to 
ensure that landowners employ trapping and translocation on their land, rather than lethal control, 
following the publication of the beaver licensing figures for 2022. 
S6W-20107 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update on 
how many businesses it estimates will close as a consequence of short-term let licensing.  
S6W-20108 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what its response is to the 
Association of Scotland’s Self-Caterers survey of June 2023, which reports that 61% of 
respondents are considering leaving the self-catering sector.  
S6W-20109 Kenneth Gibson: To ask the Scottish Government what percentage of all crimes 
were cybercrimes in the last year for which figures are available. 
S6W-20110 Kenneth Gibson: To ask the Scottish Government how much was defrauded through 
cybercrime in the last year for which figures are available. 
S6W-20111 Kenneth Gibson: To ask the Scottish Government what percentage of reported 
cybercrimes were successfully prosecuted in the last year for which figures are available. 
S6W-20112 Kenneth Gibson: To ask the Scottish Government what percentage of police 
resource is currently allocated to tackling cybercrime. 
S6W-20113 Daniel Johnson: To ask the Scottish Government whether it has done any work to 
ascertain how many tour operators have removed guaranteed departure products as a result of 
the reported disruptions to CalMac-operated ferry services.  
S6W-20114 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can provide an 
estimate of how many times its "keeping pace" power, under the UK Withdrawal from the 
European Union (Continuity) (Scotland) Act 2021, will be used in (a) 2023 and (b) 2024. 
S6W-20115 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government what action it is taking in light of 
reports that there are now no dental practices registering patients in Dunoon, and that people may 
need to travel to Glasgow to see an NHS dentist. 
S6W-20116 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government what action it is taking to expand 
the number of dental practices that are eligible to apply for the Recruitment and Retention 
Allowance in rural areas. 
S6W-20117 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of the commitment by the 
former Minister for Public Health, Women’s Health and Sport on 17 November 2022 to look into 
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including Kintyre on the list of geographical areas that are eligible to apply for the Recruitment and 
Retention Allowance, what progress has been made towards meeting this commitment.  
S6W-20118 Donald Cameron: To ask the Scottish Government what plans it has to increase the 
number of reports that it makes to the Scottish Parliament in respect of its "keeping pace" power 
under the UK Withdrawal from the European Union (Continuity) (Scotland) Act 2021. 
S6W-20120 Beatrice Wishart: To ask the Scottish Government how it plans to give effect to the 
recommendations contained in its publication, The Independent Strategic Review of Funding and 
Commissioning of Violence Against Women and Girls Services, published in June 2023. 
S6W-20121 Beatrice Wishart: To ask the Scottish Government what its response is to the 
conclusions of the Independent Strategic Review of Funding and Commissioning of Violence 
Against Women and Girls Services.  
S6W-20122 Beatrice Wishart: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6O-02399 by Gillian Martin on 21 June 2023, what its proposed timescale is for introducing 
proposals for crofting law reform.  
S6W-20123 Beatrice Wishart: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the answer to question 
S6O-02399 by Gillian Martin on 21 June 2023, whether it plans to consider reforms that devolve 
the decisions of Grazings Committees to the local level.  
S6W-20124 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what information it holds on whether 
any risk assessment was undertaken in respect of any potential corrosion of cadmium piping at 
the Queen Elizabeth University Hospital, and the possibility of a carcinogenic being released as a 
result of any such corrosion. 
S6W-20125 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government whether it was aware of any 
presence of cadmium in pipes within the air conditioning system at the Queen Elizabeth University 
Hospital. 
S6W-20126 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government what information it holds on whether 
any cadmium-plated pipes were fully water tested before the Queen Elizabeth University Hospital 
opened. 
S6W-20128 Monica Lennon: To ask the Scottish Government whether any Barnett consequential 
funding that it receives from the £200 million announced by the UK Government for the pothole 
fund in England and Wales will be passed on to local authorities. 
S6W-20129 Monica Lennon: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can provide an update 
on its spending plan for the £97 million in funding received from the UK Government to remove 
cladding from high-rise buildings, including a timetable setting out by when it anticipates it will 
have spent all of the funding. 
S6W-20130 Monica Lennon: To ask the Scottish Government, regarding the potential impact on 
widening the accessibility of and encouraging participation in sport in Scotland, what discussions it 
has had with the UK Government regarding (a) the affordability of viewing packages for Scottish 
men’s and women’s football and (b) any action that can be taken to ensure free to view access. 
S6W-20132 Ivan McKee: To ask the Scottish Government when its proposed £12 minimum wage 
for social care staff will be implemented. 
S6W-20133 Ivan McKee: To ask the Scottish Government whether it will provide an update on its 
progress towards the National Care Service Fair Work Workstream 4 on sectoral bargaining, 
including its target timescale for this being fully in place. 
S6W-20134 Jackie Baillie: To ask the Scottish Government whether any specific funding was 
provided for the cleaning of the air conditioning systems at the Queen Elizabeth University 
Hospital, and, if so, how much was allocated. 
S6W-20135 Monica Lennon: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can provide an update 
on how it is enhancing marine protection. 
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S6W-20136 Monica Lennon: To ask the Scottish Government how many incidents of illegal 
scallop dredging in Marine Protected Areas have been reported since 2021. 
S6W-20138 Maurice Golden: To ask the Scottish Government how many illicit (a) e-cigarettes 
and (b) vapes have been seized in Scotland in the past three years, broken down by year and 
local authority area. 
S6W-20139 Maurice Golden: To ask the Scottish Government what research it has carried out 
into indoor air quality in public buildings, and what plans it has to carry out any further such 
research. 
S6W-20141 Maurice Golden: To ask the Scottish Government what assessment it has made 
regarding whether constrained availability of lithium carbonate could affect its commitment to 
phase out the need for new diesel and petrol vehicles by 2030. 
S6W-20142 Ariane Burgess: To ask the Scottish Government what total marine area, in km2, of 
the continental shelf area adjacent to Scotland, as designated in the Continental Shelf 
(Designation of Areas) Order 2013, is covered by one or more designations including a (a) Special 
Area of Conservation, (b) Special Protection Area, (c) Nature Conservation Marine Protected 
Area, (d) Ramsar site for wetlands of international importance and (e) Site of Special Scientific 
Interest. 
S6W-20143 Mercedes Villalba: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the statement by the 
Cabinet Secretary for Transport, Net Zero and Just Transition on 29 June 2023, regarding Highly 
Protected Marine Areas, whether there will be any delay to the deadline of March 2024 for the 
delivery of fisheries management measures in existing Marine Protected Areas (MPAs), as set out 
in the Bute House Agreement. 
S6W-20144 Mercedes Villalba: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the statement by the 
Cabinet Secretary for Transport, Net Zero and Just Transition on 29 June 2023, regarding Highly 
Protected Marine Areas, what the timescales are for establishing fisheries management measures 
for "tranche two" of the existing Marine Protected Areas. 
S6W-20145 Mercedes Villalba: To ask the Scottish Government, in light of its commitment in the 
Bute House Agreement to "consult as soon as practicable on proposals to apply a cap to fishing 
activity in inshore waters", when it expects to deliver any such consultation. 
S6W-20146 Collette Stevenson: To ask the Scottish Government what discussions it has had 
with the UK Government, as it relates to public health in Scotland, regarding measures to ensure 
that pets brought into Scotland under the Pet Travel Scheme do not carry infectious diseases and 
parasites, including tapeworm and non-native tick species. 
S6W-20147 Paul Sweeney: To ask the Scottish Government whether it can instruct Network Rail 
Scotland to prioritise Springburn railway station for step-free access improvement works, as part of 
the Access for All scheme. 
S6W-20148 Tess White: To ask the Scottish Government, further to the announcement that 
landline phones will be installed across the Scottish prison estate for use by people in custody, 
how much the procurement and installation costs of this scheme will be for HMP Grampian.  
S6W-20149 Tess White: To ask the Scottish Government what the total cost has been of 
providing people in custody in HMP Grampian with mobile phones, since the policy was 
announced in April 2020.  
S6W-20150 Finlay Carson: To ask the Scottish Government whether local authorities have the 
ability to remove core subjects from a senior phase school without consultation under the Schools 
(Consultation) (Scotland) Act 2010.  
S6W-20151 Finlay Carson: To ask the Scottish Government what mechanism is in place to 
remedy any non-compliance by local authorities with the provisions of the Schools (Consultation) 
(Scotland) Act 2010. 
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S6W-20152 Finlay Carson: To ask the Scottish Government whether the Scottish Public Services 
Ombudsman (SPSO) has any role in relation to the curriculum offering or subjects taught in local 
authority-run schools, and, if so, what its role is. 
S6W-20153 Finlay Carson: To ask the Scottish Government what steps are required, under 
the Schools (Consultation) (Scotland) Act 2010, to (a) disestablish or dissolve an all-through 
school and (b) create new partnerships with other schools; whether pupils and parents within the 
existing catchment area have any involvement in such decisions, and, if so, what their involvement 
is.
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New Subordinate Legislation 

Subject to the negative procedure 
 
The following instrument was laid before Parliament on 19 July 2023 and is subject to the negative 
procedure— 
 
Valuation (Proposals Procedure) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/207) 
Laid under section 3ZA(10)(b) of the Local Government (Scotland) Act 1975 
 
 
The following instrument was laid before Parliament on 21 July 2023 and is subject to the negative 
procedure— 
 
Greenhouse Gas Emissions Trading Scheme (Amendment) Order 2023 (SI 2023/850) 
Laid under schedule 3 of the Climate Change Act 2008
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Progress of Legislation 

                                                                                                                                                               

A list of all Bills in progress can be accessed via the Scottish Parliament website at: 

https://www.parliament.scot/bills-and-laws/bills 
 
For each Bill, the date of the next (or most recent) event in the Bill’s passage is given. Other 
relevant information, e.g. about lodging amendments, is given in italics. 

As soon as a Public Bill (i.e. a Government, Committee or Member’s Bill) has completed Stage 1, 
amendments for consideration at Stage 2 may be lodged; and as soon as Stage 2 is completed, 
amendments for Stage 3 consideration may be lodged. The last lodging day for amendments at 
Stage 2 is four sitting days before the meeting at which those amendments will be considered (e.g. 
Wednesday for a meeting on Tuesday); at Stage 3 it is five days before. Amendments may be 
lodged until 4.30 pm on any sitting day, except on the last lodging day for each Stage, when the 
deadline is 12 noon.  
 
A Hybrid Bill is subject to the same rules except in the case of Stage 2 where amendments for 
consideration may be lodged no earlier than the completion of any consideration of evidence at 
Stage 2. 

Amendments to Private Bills are subject to different deadlines. These are set out in Rule 9A.12 of 
Standing Orders. 
 
Members are advised to lodge amendments in good time before the beginning of a Stage and as 
early as possible during the day.  
 
(G) = Government Bill; (M) = Member’s Bill; (C) = Committee Bill; (P) = Private Bill; (H) = Hybrid 
Bill. 
 
Bail and Release from Custody (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Passed, 22 June 2023 
 
Bankruptcy and Diligence (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Economy and Fair Work)), 17 May 2023 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (45th Report, 2023) 
 
Charities (Regulation and Administration) (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Passed, 28 June 2023 
 
Children (Care and Justice) (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 completed, 22 June 2023 

Stage 2 amendments may now be lodged with the clerks in the Legislation Team 
(legislationteam@parliament.scot) 

 
Circular Economy (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Introduced, 13 June 2023 

https://www.parliament.scot/bills-and-laws/bills
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Lead committee – Net Zero, Energy and Transport 
 
Disabled Children and Young People (Transitions to Adulthood) (Scotland) Bill (M) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Education, Children and Young People)), 17 May 2023 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (1st Report, 2023) 
 
European Charter of Local Self-Government (Incorporation) (Scotland) Bill (M) 
Passed, 23 March 2021 

Following a reference under section 33 of the Scotland Act 1998 by the Attorney General and 
the Advocate General for Scotland, the Supreme Court has ruled that some provisions of the 
Bill are outwith the legislative competence of the Scottish Parliament. The Bill cannot be 
submitted for Royal Assent in its unamended form. 

 
Gender Recognition Reform (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Passed, 22 December 2022 

Following an Order under section 35 of the Scotland Act 1998 made by the Secretary of 
State for Scotland, this Bill cannot be submitted for Royal Assent in its current form. 

 
National Care Service (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (evidence, lead committee (Health, Social Care and Sport)), 9 May 2023 

Report – Criminal Justice Committee (letter to lead committee, 10 February 2023) 
Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (13th Report, 2023) 
Report – Finance and Public Administration Committee (10th Report, 2022) 
Report – Education, Children and Young People Committee (11th Report, 2022) 

 
Patient Safety Commissioner for Scotland Bill (G) 
Stage 2 completed, 13 June 2023 

Stage 3 amendments may now be lodged with the clerks in the Legislation Team 
(legislationteam@parliament.scot) 

 
Police (Ethics, Conduct and Scrutiny) (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Introduced, 6 June 2023 

Lead committee – Criminal Justice 
 
Regulation of Legal Services (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Introduced, 20 April 2023 

Lead committee – Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice 
 
Scottish Employment Injuries Advisory Council Bill (M) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Social Justice and Social Security Committee)), 22 June 2023 
 
Trusts and Succession (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Delegated Powers and Law Reform)), 20 June 2023 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (7th Report, 2023) 
 
United Nations Convention on the Rights of the Child (Incorporation) (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Passed, 16 March 2021 
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Following a reference under section 33 of the Scotland Act 1998 by the Attorney General and 
the Advocate General for Scotland, the Supreme Court has ruled that some provisions of the 
Bill are outwith the legislative competence of the Scottish Parliament. The Bill cannot be 
submitted for Royal Assent in its unamended form. 

 
Victims, Witnesses, and Justice Reform (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (lead committee (Criminal Justice)), 24 May 2023 
 
Visitor Levy (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (evidence, lead committee (Local Government, Housing and Planning)), 20 June 2023 
 
Welfare of Dogs (Scotland) Bill (M) 
Introduced, 20 June 2023 

Lead committee – Rural Affairs and Islands 
 
Wildlife Management and Muirburn (Scotland) Bill (G) 
Stage 1 (evidence, lead committee (Rural Affairs and Islands)), 28 June 2023 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (40th Report, 2023) 
 

Legislative Consent Memorandums  
 
A list of all Legislative Consent Memorandums lodged with the Scottish Parliament can be 
accessed via the website at: 
 
https://www.parliament.scot/bills-and-laws/bills/legislative-consent-memorandums 

 

Animal Welfare (Kept Animals) Bill LCM-S6-1 

Lodged on 22 June 2021 

Meeting of the Parliament, 11 January 2022 

Report – Lead committee (Rural Affairs, Islands and Natural Environment) (4th Report, 2021) 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (14th Report, 2021) 

 
Data Protection and Digital Information (No. 2) Bill LCM-S6-36 
Lodged on 15 May 2023 
Meeting (lead committee (Economy and Fair Work)), 31 May 2023 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (48th Report, 2023) 
 
Economic Activity of Public Bodies (Overseas Matters) Bill LCM-S6-38 
Lodged on 19 July 2023 
 
Economic Crime and Corporate Transparency Bill Supplementary LCM-S6-35a 
Lodged on 19 June 2023 
Meeting of the Parliament, 28 June 2023 

Report – Lead committee (Criminal Justice) (13th Report, 2023) 
Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (47th Report, 2023) 

 
Electronic Trade Documents Bill Supplementary LCM-S6-37a 
Lodged on 13 June 2023 
Meeting of the Parliament, 27 June 2023 
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Report – Lead committee (Economy and Fair Work) (5th Report, 2023) 
Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (42nd Report, 2023) 

 
Energy Bill Supplementary LCM-S6-26a 
Lodged on 25 January 2022 

Report – Lead committee (Net Zero, Energy and Transport) (5th Report, 2023) 
Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (16th Report, 2023) 

 
High Speed Rail (Crewe - Manchester) Bill LCM-S6-15 
Lodged on 7 February 2022 

Report – Lead committee (Net Zero, Energy and Transport) (9th Report, 2022) 
Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (27th Report, 2022) 

 
Levelling-up and Regeneration Bill LCM-S6-23 
Lodged on 27 July 2022 

Report – Lead committee (Net Zero, Energy and Transport) (14th Report, 2022) 
Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (59th Report, 2022) 

 

Northern Ireland Protocol Bill LCM-S6-24 

Lodged on 19 August 2022 

Meeting of the Parliament, 29 June 2022 

Report – Lead committee (Constitution, Europe, External Affairs and Culture) (7th Report, 2022) 
Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (55th Report, 2022) 

 

Northern Ireland Troubles (Legacy and Reconciliation) Bill Supplementary LCM-S6-27a 

Lodged on 16 June 2023 

Meeting of the Parliament, 28 June 2023 

Report – Lead committee (Criminal Justice) (12th Report, 2023) 

 

Online Safety Bill Supplementary LCM-S6-18a 

Lodged on 1 June 2023 

Meeting of the Parliament, 29 June 2023 

Report – Lead committee (Criminal Justice) (14th Report, 2023) 
 

Powers of Attorney Bill LCM-S6-34 
Lodged on 16 March 2023 
Meeting of the Parliament, 24 May 2023 

Report – Lead committee (Health, Social Care and Sport) (5th Report, 2023) 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (25th Report, 2023) 
 

Procurement Bill Supplementary LCM-S6-20a 

Lodged on 3 February 2023 

Meeting of the Parliament, 16 March 2023 

Report – Lead committee (Economy and Fair Work) (2nd Report, 2023) 

Report – Delegated Powers and Law Reform Committee (18th Report, 2023) 

                             Subordinate Legislation (date of laying) (lead committee) 
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Affirmative instruments 
 
Subject to approval by 13 September 2023  
 
Cost of Living (Tenant Protection) (Scotland) Act 2022 (Amendment of Expiry Date) Regulations 
2023 (SSI 2023/Draft) (1 June 2023) (Local government, Housing and Planning Committee) 
 
Subject to approval by 28 September 2023 
 
Land and Buildings Transaction Tax (Green Freeports Relief) (Scotland) Order 2023 (SSI 
2023/Draft) (16 June 2023) (Finance and Public Administration Committee) 
 
Subject to approval by 3 October 2023 
 
Deer (Firearms etc.) (Scotland) Amendment Order 2023 (SSI 2023/Draft) (21 June 2023) (Rural 
Affairs and Islands Committee) 
 
Subject to approval by 28 October 2023 
 
Deposit and Return Scheme for Scotland (Miscellaneous Amendment) Regulations 2023 (SSI 
2023/Draft) (30 June 2023) (Net Zero, Energy and Transport Committee) 
 
Negative instruments 
 
Subject to annulment 6 September 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 4 September 2023 
 
Packaging Waste (Data Reporting) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023160) 
(25 May 2023) (Net Zero, Energy and Transport Committee) 
 
Food (Scotland) Act 2015 (Compliance Notices) Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/161) (25 May 2023) 
(Health, Social Care and Sport Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 13 September 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 11 September 2023 
 
Act of Sederunt (Fees of Solicitors in the Court of Session, Sheriff Appeal Court and Sheriff Court) 
(Taxation of Judicial Expenses Rules) (Amendment) 2023 (SSI 2023/165) (1 June 2023) 
(Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Feed Additives (Form of Provisional Authorisations) (Cobalt(II) Compounds) (Scotland) 
Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/170) (1 June 2023) (Rural Affairs and Islands Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 14 September 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 11 September 2023 
 
Lews Castle College (Transfer and Closure) (Scotland) Order 2023 (SSI 2023/171) (2 June 2023) 
(Education, Children and Young People Committee) 
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Coronavirus (Recovery and Reform) (Scotland) Act 2022 (Early Expiry of Provisions) Regulations 
2023 (SSI 2023/172) (2 June 2023) (Criminal Justice Committee) 
 
National Health Service (Charges to Overseas Visitors) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2023 
(SSI 2023/173) (2 June 2023) (Health, Social Care and Sport Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 20 September 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 18 September 2023 
 
Building (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/177) (8 June 2023) (Local 
Government, Housing and Planning Committee) 
 
Legal Aid and Advice and Assistance (Miscellaneous Amendment) (Scotland) (No. 3) Regulations 
2023 (SSI 2023/178) (8 June 2023) (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 27 September 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 25 September 2023 
 
National Health Service (Free Prescriptions and Charges for Drugs and Appliances) (Scotland) 
Amendment Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/181) (15 June 2023) (Health, Social Care and Sport 
Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 3 October 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 2 October 2023 
 
Deer (Close Seasons) (Scotland) Amendment Order 2023 (SSI 2023/184) (21 June 2023) (Rural 
Affairs and Islands Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 4 October 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 2 October 2023 
 
Teachers’ Superannuation and Pension Scheme (Miscellaneous Amendments) (Scotland) 
Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/190) (22 June 2023) (Education, Children and Young People 
Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 5 October 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 2 October 2023 
 
Cereal Seed (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/193) (23 June 2023) (Rural 
Affairs and Islands Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 25 October 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 23 October 2023 
 
Council Tax Reduction (Scotland) Amendment (No. 2) Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/197) (27 June 
2023) (Equalities, Human Rights and Civil Justice Committee) 
 
Subject to annulment 29 October 2023 
Lead Committee report due by 23 October 2023 

https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/172/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/172/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/173/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/173/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/177/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/178/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/178/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/181/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/181/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/184/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/190/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/190/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/193/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/197/contents/made
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Valuation (Proposals Procedure) (Scotland) Amendment Regulations 2023 (SSI 2023/207) (19 
July 2023) (Local government, Housing and Planning Committee) 
 
Greenhouse Gas Emissions Trading Scheme (Amendment) Order 2023 (SI 2023/850) (21 July 
2023) (Net Zero, Energy and Transport Committee) 
 

https://www.legislation.gov.uk/ssi/2023/207/contents/made
https://www.legislation.gov.uk/uksi
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New Documents 

Committee Reports 
 
For further information on accessing committee reports, please contact the relevant clerk or 
webpage (see end of Bulletin for contact details or access general committee webpage) 
 
Legislative Consent Memorandum 
 
The following memorandum was lodged on 19 July 2023— 
 

Shona Robison, Deputy First Minister and Cabinet Secretary for Finance: Legislative 
Consent Memorandum on the Economic Activity of Public Bodies (Overseas Matters) Bill 
(UK Parliament legislation) (LCM-S6-38)  

 
Other Documents 

The following documents were laid before the Parliament on 17 July 2023 and are not subject to 
parliamentary procedure— 
 
British Tourist Authority trading as VisitBritain and VisitEngland Annual Report and 
Accounts for the year ended 31 March 2023 (SG/2023/125) laid under Section 88 of the 
Scotland Act 1998  
 
Competition and Markets Authority Annual Report and Accounts for 2022/23 (CMA/2023/02) 
laid under the Enterprise and Regulatory Reform Act 2013, sch4 s14(3)(a) (as amended by the 
United Kingdom Internal Market Act 2020, s40(3))  
 
National Heritage Memorial Fund Annual Report and Accounts 2022 – 2023 (SG/2023/98) 
laid under Section 88 of the Scotland Act 1998 
 
The National Lottery Heritage Fund Annual Report and Accounts 2022 – 2023 (SG/2023/97) 
laid under Section 34(6) of the National Lottery etc. Act 1993  
 
Scottish Canals - Corporate Plan 2023-28 (SG/2023/132) laid at the request of a member of the 
Scottish Government and not under any laying power 
 
The following documents were laid before the Parliament on 18 July 2023 and are not subject to 
parliamentary procedure— 
 
Agriculture and Horticulture Development Board Annual Report and Accounts 2022/2023 
(SG/2023/118) laid under Article 13 of the Agriculture and Horticulture Development Board Order 
2008 (S.I. 2008, No. 576)  
 
Criminal Injuries Compensation Authority Annual Report & Accounts 2022-23 (SG/2023/129) 
laid under Section 6 of the Criminal Injuries Compensation Act 1995  
 
Financial Reporting Advisory Board Annual Report 2022-23 (SG/2023/148) laid at the request 
of a member of the Scottish Government and not under any laying power 
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The following documents were laid before the Parliament on 19 July 2023 and are not subject to 
parliamentary procedure— 
 
NHS Blood and Transplant Annual Report and Accounts 2022-23 (SG/2023/136) laid under 
section 88 of the Scotland Act 1998  
 
Office of the Scottish Charity Regulator (OSCR) Annual Report & Accounts 2022-23 
(SG/2023/149) laid under Chapter 1, Section 2 of the Charities and Trustee Investment (Scotland) 
Act 2005 
 
Scottish Public Services Ombudsman: Compendium of Case Reports for July 2023 
(SPSO/2023/07) laid under Sections 15(1) and 15(1A) of the Scottish Public Services 
Ombudsman Act 2002 
 
Transport Focus Annual report and accounts 2022-23 (SG/2023/122) laid under paragraph 
11(6) of Schedule 5 of the Railways Act 2005 
 
The following documents were laid before the Parliament on 20 July 2023 and are not subject to 
parliamentary procedure— 
 
Gambling Commission Annual Report and Accounts 2022 to 2023 (SG/2023/44) laid under 
Section 88 of the Scotland Act 1998 
 
HMICS Custody Inspection Report - Tayside (HMICS/2023/04) laid under section 79(3) of the 
Police and Fire Reform (Scotland) Act  
 
Industrial Development Act 1982 Annual Report by the Secretary of State for Business and 
Trade, the First Minister of Scotland, and the Welsh Ministers for the year ended 31 March 
2023 (SG/2023/126) laid under Section 15 of the Industrial Development Act 1982 
 
The following documents were laid before the Parliament on 21 July 2023 and are not subject to 
parliamentary procedure— 
 
British Transport Police Fund Annual Report and Accounts for the year ending 31 March 
2023 (SG/2023/120) laid under Section 88 of the Scotland Act 1998 
 
The King's Printer for Scotland Report covering the period 1 April 2021 to 31 March 2022 
(SG/2023/152) laid at the request of a member of the Scottish Government and not under any 
laying power 
 
National Crime Agency Annual Report and Accounts 2022-2023 (SG/2023/130) laid under 
Paragraph 8(3) of Schedule 2 to the Crime and Courts Act 2013  
 
Security Industry Authority Annual Report & Accounts 2022/23 (SG/2023/151) 
laid under paragraph 17(3) of Schedule 1 to the Private Security Industry Act 2001  
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Contacts for Further Information 

All telephone numbers 0131 348 XXXX 
Web site: https://www.parliament.scot 

General Enquiries 5000 

Chamber Desk (Motions and Questions) 5199 

Parliamentary Business Team (Chamber, Parliamentary Bureau) 5187 

Legislation Team 5277 

Non-Government Bills Unit (NGBU) 6124 

 
Committee web sites at: 
https://www.parliament.scot/chamber-and-committees/committees 

  

 
MSP Details 
https://www.parliament.scot/msps/current-and-previous-msps

https://www.parliament.scot/
https://www.parliament.scot/chamber-and-committees/committees
https://www.parliament.scot/msps/current-and-previous-msps
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